
ORDINANCENO.
9/23122,1:08PM RFAFormSystem

212A6--

Ordinance 5gptp[R@WEE©
¼rsion3.2releasedon8f3/21
UseforallOrdinancesincluding:TRO,Budget,Zoning,Declarations OCT 26 2022
TrustIndentures,etc.

Tulsa City Council

CITYCOUNCllUSE ONLY Tracking#: A2 - CITYCLERK USE ONLY
DateReceived: Committee: O Scanned Date: .C 2 r1D.11
CommitteeDate: /D

- 14- f S HearingDate: - s
1"AgendaDate: /)-I4 - 4 A 2d AgendaDate: IC -A b -o O Posted Item#221U.U22

AIIdepartmentItemsrequiringCouncilapprovalmust be submittedthroughtheMayor'sOffice.

Primary Details

Dept.TrackingNo. BoardApproval OtherBoardName CityCouncilApproval

9 Yes O No

Department ContactName Email Phone

DevelopmentServices Bob Kolibas rkolibas@cityoftulsa.org 918-596-1612

Subject(Description) OrdinanceType
2020NationalElectricalCode Title52 AmendingPreviousOrdinance

Section Township Range Lot

Block Address BAICTNumber

AmendingOrd.No. TROTitleNo. TROSubtitle Property/Non.Property

e.g.43 e.g.G

CouncilDistrict ZoningNo. PUDNo. PlanningDistrict

Budget

FundingSource(s)

TOTAL:
Enterthofundingsource(s)usingtheappropriateMuntsfundIngbrmat·Org(AllocationCode)-Object-Amount(1001211-531401-$10.00)orProjectString-Amount
(144104.AbstrTide5413102.6001-4043122-541102•$30,000.01)

Approvals

Department: e Date: /O
' 0 ML

Legal: . b 6JiA/ Date:6 c T.

Board: Date: ..

Mayor: ism Date: I U 3 /JR

Other MeyrirprnTam
Date:

PollCy Statement

BackgroundInformation

ProvidebackgroundInbrmationontherequestedaction.

SummationoftheRequestedAction

UpdatingtheNationalElectricalCode from2017to2020

Summarizethepartinentdetailsoftherequestedaction.

EmergencyClause? ReasonforEmergencyClause

O Yes
O NO ExplainwhyyouarerequestingthattheCityCouncilapprovethisactionwithanemergencyclause.

apps.cityoftulsa.org/RFA/Forms/#/form/print/4815d29d-8d8f-4797-9037-9e15d02f27c6 1/2



9/23/22,1:08PM RFAFormSystem

Processing Information forCityClerk'sOffice

PostExecutionProcessing AdditionalRoutingandProcessingDetails
O Mailvendorcopy(addt'Isignaturecopiesattached)
O Mustbefiledwithothergovemmentalentity
O Addflgovemmentalentityapproval(s)required

apps,cityoftulsa.org/RFA/Forms/#/form/print/4815d29d-8d8f-4797-9037-9e15d02f27c6 2/2



(PublishedintheTulsa World,

I/eNÁfr g ,2022.)

ORDINANCE NO. 24938

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE 52 TULSA REVISED ORDINANCES (TRO),

"ELECTRICAL CODE"; ADOPTING THE 2020 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE;

REPLACING TITLE 52 TRO'S EXISTING CHAPTER 1 WITH A NEW CHAPTER 1,

"ADMINISTRATION"; REPLACING TITLE 52 TRO'S EXISTING CHAPTER 2

WITH A NEW CHAPTER 2,"AMENDMENTS TO NATIONAL ELECTRICAL

CODE, 2020 EDITION"; ADDING OR DELETING CERTAIN AMENDED

SECTIONS, AS PROVIDED HEREIN; REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES OR PARTS

OF ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY;

AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF TULSA:

Section1. That Title52, TulsaRevised Ordinances,Chapter 1 and 2,be and thesame

hereby are amended by adopting the2020 NationalElectricalCode, toread asfollows:

"Title52. ELECTRICAL CODE

Chapter 1.Administration

Chapter 2.Amendments to National ElectricalCode, 2020 Edition

CHAPTER 1.-ADMINISTRATION

Section 100.Adoption of National ElectricalCode, 2020 Edition (NFPA 70-2020)

A certaindocument, three(3)copiesofwhich areon fileintheOfficeoftheCityClerkoftheCity

of Tulsa,Oklahoma being marked and designatedas theNationalElectricalCode, 2020 Edition

(NFPA 70-2020),as publishedby the National FireProtectionAssociation(NPFA), ishereby

adopted as part of the Tulsa Revised Ordinances, hereinafterthe "ElectricalCode," for the

installation,alteration,repairand regulationofelectricalsystemsand equipment servingbuildings

and structuresexceptdetachedone-and two-familydwellingsand townhouses notmore thanthree

(3) storiesabove grade plane in heightwith a separatemeans of egressand whose accessory

structuresshallcomply with Tulsa Revised Ordinances,Title51 Chapter 2. Each and allof the

terms,conditions,regulations,provisions,and penaltiesof the National ElectricalCode, 2020

Edition(NFPA 70-2020) are hereby referredto,adopted and made a partof the Tulsa Revised

Ordinances as iffullysetout inthistitle,with amendments. As used inthistitle,theNational

1



ElectricalCode, 2020 Edition(NFPA 70-2020),as amended by thistitle,may be referredtoas the

"code."

Section 101. -Applicability.

101.1 Existing Structures
- Added. Except as otherwiseprovided inthistitle,thiscode shallnot

requirethe removal,alterationor abandonment of,nor preventcontinued use of an existing
electricalsystem.

101.2 Alteration,Additions, or Repairs - Added. The alteration,additionor repairof any
electricalsystem shallconform to requirementsfora new electricalsystem, without requiringthe

entireexistingsystem tocomply with allof the requirementsof thiscode. Alterations,additions

and repairsshallnot cause an existingsystem to become unsafe or adverselyaffectthe

performance of thesystem. Where additionsor alterationssubjectpartsof an existingsystem to

loadsexceeding thosepermittedinthiscode, such partsshallbe made tocomply with thiscode.

101.3 Referenced Standards - Added. The standardsreferencedinthiscode shallbe deemed

incorporatedby referenceintothiscode, totheextentprescribedby each reference.Where

differencesoccur between provisionsof thiscode and the referencedstandards,theprovisionsof

thiscode shallapply.

101.4 Maintenance - Added. Electricalsystems,equipment, materialsand appurtenances,both

existingand new, and partsthereofshallbe maintained ina safe,hazard-freecondition.Devices

or safeguardsthatarerequiredby thiscode shallbe maintained incompliance with thecode

editionunder which installed.The owner or the owner's designatedagent shallbe responsiblefor

the maintenance of theelectricalsystems and equipment. To determine compliance with this

provision,thecode officialshallhave theauthorityto requirethattheelectricalsystems and

equipment be re-inspected.

Section 102. - Officeof electricalinspection.

102.1 Authority Having Jurisdiction- Added. Pursuantto Title11,Tulsa Revised Ordinances,

Chapter 2,the Directorof Planning and Development, or the Director'sdesignated

representative,as provided by Title51, Chapter 1,Section 103.2,Tulsa Revised Ordinances,

shalldirecttheadministrationof the ElectricalCode of the City of Tulsa.

102.2 Conflictof InterestProhibited -Added. ElectricalInspectorsshallascribetoand be

guided inprofessionalconduct as City of Tulsa representatives,as provided inTitle12,Chapter

6,Tulsa Revised Ordinances,the "EthicsCode".

102.3 Duties of Code Official-Added. The code officialshallenforceallof theprovisionsof

thiscode and shallacton any questionrelativetothe installation,alterationand operationof

electricalsystems and equipment.

102.4 Authority to Disconnect Service Utilities- Added. The code officialshallhave the

authoritytoauthorizedisconnectionof utilityservicesor energy sourcesto the building,structure

or system regulatedby thiscode incase of an emergency where itisnecessarytoeliminatean

immediate hazard to lifeor propertyor to abatea violationof thiscode. The code officialshall

notifytheservingutilityand, wherever possible,the owner and occupant of thebuilding,

2



.

structureor servicesystem of the decisiontodisconnectpriortotakingsuch action.Ifnot

notifiedpriortodisconnecting,theowner or occupant of the building,structureor servicesystem
shallbe notifiedinwritingas soon as practicalthereafter.A person shallnot make utilityservice

or energy source connectionsto systems regulatedby thiscode, which have been disconnectedor

ordered to be discontinuedby thecode official,or the use of which has been ordered tobe

discontinuedby thecode officialuntilthecode officialauthorizesthe reconnectionand use of

such systems.

102.5 Authority to Condemn ElectricalSystems - Added. Wherever thecode official

determines thatany electricalsystem, or portionthereof,regulatedby thiscode has become

hazardous to life,healthor property,thecode officialshallorder inwritingthatsuch electrical

systems eitherbe removed or restoredto a safecondition.A time limitforcompliance with such

ordershallbe specifiedinthe writtennotice.A person shallnot use or maintain a defective

electricalsystem or equipment afterreceivingsuch notice.

Section 103.- Approval.

103.1 Approved Materials and Equipment
-Added. All materials,equipment, and devices

approved by thecode officialforuse under theadministrationof thiscode shallbe constructed

and installedinaccordance with such approval.

103.2 Alternative Materials and Equipment -Added. The provisionsof thiscode shallnot

preventthe installationof any materialor prohibitany method of constructionnot specifically

prescribedby thiscode, provided thatthealternativematerialor method has been approved by
thecode official.An alternativematerialor method of constructionshallbe approved when the

code officialfindsthattheproposed design satisfactorilycomplies with the intentof thiscode,

and thatthematerial,method, or work offeredisforthepurpose intended.Any and all

alternativematerialsor methods of constructionshallbe equal toor greaterinquality,strength,

effectiveness,fireresistance,durabilityand safetythan thatprescribedinthiscode.

103.3 Labeling
-Added. Electricalmaterialsand equipment regulatedby thiscode shallbe

listedand labeledby an Occupational Safetyand Health Administration(OSHA) Nationally

Recognized Testing Laboratory,indicatingthatthey have been testedand evaluatedforthe

intendedapplicationby an approved agency, unlessthey areotherwiseapproved as provided in

thistitle.

Exception:

Unlabeled Equipment -Added. The followingprocedures shallbe employed foracceptance of

any unlabeledequipment:

1. The applianceor equipment shallbe investigatedand testedby an engineerregisteredin

theStateof Oklahoma, who isqualifiedinthefieldof thespecificapplianceor equipment
to be tested.The engineershallnot be affiliatedinany manner with themanufacturing or

distributionof theapplianceor equipment.

2. A letterbearingthe signatureand sealof an engineerregisteredintheStateof Oklahoma

shallbe furnishedtothe code officialand shallincludethe following information:

3



a. A statementrequestingexemption from the labelingrequirements setforthin the

NationalElectricalCode.

b. A specificdescriptionof the appliance or equipment with the model and serial

numbers.

c. The purpose theapplianceor equipment isto serve.

d. The type of investigationand testperformed. Testing and evaluationshallbe in

accordance with National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 791,
Recommended Practice and Procedures for Unlabeled ElectricalEquipment
Evaluations.

e. The dateand resultsof the investigationand testperformed.

f. A statementfrom theengineerthattheequipment issafeforitsintendeduse.

3. The installationof theapplianceor equipment shallbe approved upon acceptanceof the

letterby thecode official.

103.5 Construction Documents -Added. Any constructiondocuments, includingplansand

specificationsthatarerequiredby thiscode or any otheradopted code governing construction,
shallbe provided tothecode officialupon request.

Section 104. - Permits.

104.1 Payment of Fees - Added. No permit shallbe issueduntilthefeesprescribedinTitle49

Tulsa Revised Ordinances have been paid.

104.2 Permit Required -Added. No person,firm,partnership,corporation,or limitedliability

company shalldo or cause to be done any electricalwork without firsthaving obtainedan

electricalpermit.Electricalpermitsshallnot be transferable.

Exception. Where equipment replacementsand repairsmust be performed inan emergency

situation,the permitapplicationshallbe submitted withinthenext working businessday.

104.2.1Qualificationof Permit Applicants - Added. No electricalpermit shallbe issuedtoany

person,firm,partnership,corporation,or limitedliabilitycompany untilsuch person,firm,

partnership,corporationor limitedliabilitycompany has produced evidence of having intheir

possessiontherequiredlicensesand registrations.

104.3 Permit Not Required - Added. A permit isnot requiredforrepairsthatdo not involve

alterationor rearrangement of theelectricalinstallation.

104.4 Work Started Without a Permit - Added. Ifwork isinitiatedpriortothe issuanceof the

requiredpermit,a penaltyfeeshallbe charged inaccordance with Title49, Tulsa Revised

Ordinances.The assessment or payment of thisfeeshallnot relieveany person from fully

complying with allrequirementsof thiscode nor shallsuch payment exempt thepersons from

furtherpenalty,such as suspension or revocationof theirCertificateof Registration.

104.5 Expiration of Permit - Added. Unless extended by thecode official,any permit shallbe

invalidiftheauthorizedwork isnot commenced withinsix(6)months afterissuanceof the

4



permit,or iftheauthorizedwork issuspended or abandoned fora periodof six(6)months after

thetime work commenced.

104.6 Revocation of Permit - Added. The code officialshallrevoke any permit or approval
issuedpursuanttothiscode, intheevent itisdiscoveredthatthepermit or approval was issued

based upon a falsestatementor misrepresentationof factmateriallyaffectingthepermit

applicationor constructiondocuments.

104.7 Annual Permits -Added. Annual permitsshallbe issuedinaccordance with Tulsa

Revised Ordinances,Title50.

104.7.1Annual Permit -Amendatory. An annual permit isa yearlypermit which representsa

group of individualpermitsforeach alterationtoan alreadyexistingelectrical,gas,mechanical

or plumbing installation.The buildingofficialisauthorizedto issuean annual permit upon

applicationthereforto any person,firm or corporationregularlyemploying one or more qualified

tradespersonsinthebuilding,structureor on thepremises owned or operated by theapplicantfor

thepermit.

104.7.2Annual permit records -
Amendatory. The person to whom an annual permit isissued

shallkeep a detailedrecordof alterationsmade under such annual permit.The buildingofficial

shallhave accesstosuch detailedrecordsof alterationsatalltimes.At thecompletion of the

entity'sannual permitterm,theapplicantshallfilesuch detailedrecordsof alterationswith the

buildingofficial.Pursuantto theauthorityof 59 O.S. § 1000.25,thebuildingofficialshallcollect

feesforeach individualpermit which ispartof theannual permit once thedetailedrecordsare

submitted and remitsuch feestothe OUBCC.

Section 105. - Inspections.

105.1 Inspection Required - Added. Work shallbe subjectto inspectionby thecode official

and such work shallremain accessibleand exposed untilapproved. Approval as a resultof an

inspectionshallnot be construedas an approval of a violationof thiscode.

105.2 Request for Inspection -Added. Itshallbe theduty of thepermit holderto request

inspections.

105.3 Work Open for Approval -Added. Work thatiscovered or concealed without approval
of thecode officialshallbe subjecttopenaltyas establishedby Title49, Tulsa Revised

Ordinances.

105.4 Exception for Emergencies
-Added. For emergency work outsideregularbusiness

hours,includingweekends and holidays,a utilitycompany may connect electricalserviceto any
electricalinstallationwhich the utilitycompany deems to be safe.In such cases,theutility

company shallnotifytheOfficeof ElectricalInspectionno laterthan thefirstwork day afterthe

electricalconnection was made so the installationcan be inspected.

105.5 Final Inspection- Added. Upon completion of theelectricalwork, thepermit holdershall

requesta finalinspection.Ifthe work complies with thecode, thecode officialshallissuea

writtennoticeindicatingapproval of the work. Ifthework does not comply with thecode, the

5



code officialshallleavewrittennoticeidentifyingthedeficiencies.Appropriate correctionsand

re-inspectionsshallbe made beforea finalinspectionisapproved.

105.6 Other Inspections-Added. In additiontothe inspectionsspecifiedinthistitle,thecode

officialisauthorizedto make or requireotherinspectionstoensure compliance with the

provisionsof thiscode and otherlaws.

105.7 Downtime and Reconnect Inspections-Added. The electricutilityisauthorizedto

disconnectand reconnectan electricalserviceon permittedwork beforean inspectionby the

code officialwith thefollowingconditions:

1. The servicethatisbeing alterediscurrentlyinuse.

2. A permit has been issuedforthe work tobe performed.

3. The requestshallbe made twenty-four(24)hours inadvance and clearedwith theelectric

utilityprovider.

4. The electricalcontractorshallcontacttheCity of Tulsa Permit Center and theapplication
shallbe forwarded to theelectricutilityprovider.

5. Immediately upon completion of the installation,the electricalcontractorshallcallfor

an inspection.

6. The contractor,inadvance of the inspectionand incoordinationwith the electricutility

providershallremove allmeter,cabinet,and panel covers.

7. Violationof theseconditionsmay resultintheelectricalcontractorbeing prohibitedfrom

requestingDowntime and Reconnect Inspectionsinthefuture.

105.8 Right of Entry - Added. Where itisnecessaryto make an inspectiontoenforcethe

provisionsof thiscode, or where thecode officialhas reasonablecause to believethatthere

existsina structureor upon a premises a conditionwhich iscontrarytoor inviolationof this

code which makes thestructureor premises unsafe,dangerous or hazardous,thecode officialis

authorizedtoenterthestructureor premises atreasonabletimes to inspector to perform the

dutiesimposed by thiscode, provided thatifsuch structureor premises be occupied that

credentialsbe presentedto theoccupant and entryrequested.Ifsuch structureor premises is

unoccupied, thecode officialshallfirstmake a reasonableeffortto locatetheowner or other

person having charge or controlof thestructureor premises and requestentry.Ifentryisrefused,

thecode officialshallhave recourseto theremedies provided by law tosecureentry.

Section 106.- Violations.

106.1 Unlawful Acts -Added. Itshallbe unlawful,an offenseand a misdemeanor forany

person,firm,partnership,corporation,or limitedliabilitycompany to erect,construct,alter,

repair,remove, demolish,or operateelectricalequipment regulatedby thiscode, or cause same

to be done, inconflictwith or inviolationof any provisionof thiscode.

106.2 Notice of Violation - Added. The code officialshallservea noticeof violationor orderon

theperson responsiblefortheerection,installation,alteration,extension,repair,removal,

demolition,or operationof electricalequipment or systems inviolationof thiscode. The order

shalldirectthe person responsibleto discontinuethe illegalactionor conditionand toabatethe

6



violation.Ifcorrectiveactionisnot taken,thecode officialmay filea writtencomplaint in

Municipal Court or requesttheCity Attorney to institutetheappropriateproceeding in law.

106.3 Violation Penalties-Added. Any person violatingany of the provisionsof thiscode shall

be guiltyof a misdemeanor offenseand, upon convictionthereof,shallbe punished by a fineof

not more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars($1,200.00),excluding costs,fees,and

assessments,or by imprisonment intheCity Jailfora periodnot exceeding six(6)months, or by
both such fineand imprisonment. Each day thata violationcontinuesafteran orderor noticehas

been served shallbe deemed a separateoffense.

106.4 Abatement of Violation -Added. Impositionof criminalpenaltiesprescribedinthistitle

shallnot precludetheCity Attorney from institutingappropriateactionto restrainor enjoin
unlawful construction,the illegaloccupancy of a building,or to stopan illegalact,conduct,

business,or operationof electricalequipment or systems,or toabateany such violation.

Section 107. - Stop work order.

107.1 Notice - Added. Upon noticefrom thecode officialthatwork on any structureisbeing
conducted contrarytothe provisionsof thiscode or inan unsafeand dangerous manner, such

work shallbe immediately stopped.A stopwork order shallbe inwritingand shallbe given to

theowner of thepropertyinvolved,or totheowner's agent,or tothe person doing thework. The

stopwork ordershallstatethe conditionsunder which work willbe permittedtoresume. Where

an emergency exists,thecode officialshallnot be requiredto give a writtennoticepriorto

stoppingthework.

107.2 Unlawful Continuance - Added. Any person who shallcontinueany work afterhaving
been served with a stopwork order,except such work as he isdirectedto perform to remove a

violationor unsafe condition,shallbe guiltyof a misdemeanor offenseas prescribedinSection

106.2of thistitle.

107.3 Unsafe ElectricalSystems
-Added. An electricalsystem thatisunsafe,constitutesa fire

or healthhazard,or isotherwisedangerous to human life,as regulatedby thiscode, ishereby
declaredan unsafeelectricalsystem. Use of an electricalsystem regulatedby thiscode

constitutinga hazard to health,safetyor welfareby reasonof inadequatemaintenance,

dilapidation,firehazard,disaster,damage or abandonment ishereby declaredto be a public

nuisance,and shallbe abated by repair,rehabilitation,demolitionor removal.

Section 108. - Means of appeal
- Added.

Appeals of orders,decisionsor determinationsmade by thecode officialrelativeto the

applicationand interpretationof thiscode, shallbe made tothe Board of Appeals as established

by Title51,Chapter 1,Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

Section 109. - Registrationof electricalcontractors.

109.1 General -Added. No person,firm,limitedliabilitycompany, or corporationshallbe

issueda permit,engage inor offerto engage in,by advertisementor otherwise,any electrical

work intheCity of Tulsa as a contractorunlesssuch person,firm,limitedliabilitycompany, or

corporationhas properlyregisteredwith theCity of Tulsa.All contractors,journeymen, and

7



apprenticesshallcarrytheirstatelicenseon theirperson atalltimes while performing electrical

work withintheCity of Tulsa and shalldisplaythesame upon requestfrom thecode officialor a

policeofficerof theCity of Tulsa.No person issueda contractor'slicenseshallemploy or

supervisepersons performing electricalwork unlessthoseperson(s)are licensedor allow any

apprenticeto perform electricalwork unlesstheapprenticeshallhave directsupervisionby a

properlylicensedperson.

109.2 Requirements for Registration
-Added. No person,firm,partnership,corporation,or

limitedliabilitycompany shallbe issueda Certificateof RegistrationunlesstheCity shallhave

been furnishedproofof the issuanceof a currentStateof Oklahoma contractorlicenseissued

under the provisionsof 59 O.S.2001, §§ 1680,etseq.,as amended, and the feesestablishedin

Title49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances shallhave been paid to theCity.

109.3 Transfer of RegistrationProhibited
- Added. No person,firm,partnership,corporation,

or limitedliabilitycompany shallallow itsname tobe used by any otherperson,firm,

partnership,corporation,or limitedliabilitycompany toobtainany permit or do any electrical

work under itsregistration.

109.4 RegistrationafterRevocation
- Added. No person,firm,partnership,corporation,or

limitedliabilitycompany shallbe permittedto obtaina new registrationwithinone (1)year from

thedateof revocationof any priorregistration.

109.5 Expiration of Registration
-Added. Registrationof statelicensedcontractorsshall

expireon the birthdateof the licenseeeach year.

109.6 Identificationof Service Vehicles - Added. Every contractorshallidentifyallservice

vehiclesused inthecontractor'sbusinesswith thecompany name and contractor'slicense

number. Such lettersand numbers shallbe no lessthan two (2)inchesinheight,shallbe of a

contrastingcolor,and shallbe placed on both sidesof allservicevehicles.

109.7 Suspension or Revocation of Certificatesof Registration
- Added. Certificatesof

Registrationmay be suspended or revoked by the Board of Appeals inaccordance with Title51,

Chapter 1,Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

Section 110. - Registrationfees
- Added. Fees shallbe charged forcertificatesof registration

and renewals inaccordance with Title49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

CHAPTER 2.-AMENDMENTS TO NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2020 EDITION

ARTICLE 100: DEFINITIONS - Amendatory

Article100 of theNationalElectricalCode, 2020 Edition(NFPA 70-2020) isadopted as

published,provided thatthefollowingdefinitionsinArticle100 areadded to read as follows:

Bracketing
-Added. The installationof open wires,supportedby metal or wood brackets,along

or acrosstheexteriorof buildings.

8



Nationally Recognized Testing Laboratory - Added. A testingfacilitygiven thisdesignation
from the United StatesOccupational Safetyand Health Administration(OSHA) thatprovides

product safetytestingand certificationservicesto manufacturers.

110.12 (B) Integrityof ElectricalEquipment and Connections -Amendatory. Internalparts
of electricalequipment, includingbusbars,wiring terminals,insulators,and othersurfaces,shall

not be damaged or contaminated by foreignmaterialssuch as paint,plaster,cleaners,abrasives,
or corrosiveresidues.There shallbe no damaged partsthatmay adverselyaffectsafeoperation
or mechanical strengthof theequipment such as partsthatare broken; bent;cut;or deteriorated

by corrosion,chemical actionor overheating.Damaged materials,equipment, appliances,and

devicesshallnot be reused unlesssuch elements have been reconditioned,tested,and placed in

good and proper working conditionand approved by a nationallyrecognized testinglaboratory,
or by the manufacturer of theequipment. Electricalequipment damaged by naturalor man-made

eventsshallbe reusedonly as recommended by the manufacturer of such equipment.

210.08 (F) Outdoor Outlets.All outdoor outletsfordwellings,otherthan thosecovered in210.8

(A) (3),Exception to(3),and formini-split-typeheating/ventilating/air-conditioning(HVAC)

equipment and otherHVAC unitsemploying power conversion equipment as a means to control

compressor speed,thataresuppliedby single-phasebranch circuitsrated150 voltsot ground or

less,50 amperes or less,shallhave ground-faultcircuit-interrupterprotectionforpersonnel.
InformationalNote: Power conversion equipment istheterm used to describethecomponents
used in HVAC equipment thatiscommonly referredto as a variablespeed drive.The use of

power conversion equipment to controlcompressor speed differsfrom multistagecompressor

speed control.Exception:Ground-faultcircuit-interrupterprotectionshallnot be requiredon

lightingoutletsotherthan those covered in210.8 (C).

210.12 Are-Fault Circuit Interrupter Protection.-Added. Arc-FaultCircuitInterrupter
Protectionshallbe requiredforexistingelectricalsystems thatdo not have AFCI protection
when any new circuitor receptacleisadded to theexistingsystem.

210.19 (A) (4)Other Loads -
Amendatory. Branch-circuitconductors thatsupply loadsother

than those specifiedin210.2 and otherthan cooking appliancesas covered in210.19 (A)(3)shall

have an ampacity sufficientforthe loadsserved and shallnot be smallerthan 14 AWG. 20

ampere general-purposebranch circuitsfordwellings shallsupply a maximum of 10 outlets,15

ampere general-purposebranch circuitsfordwellings shallsupply a maximum of 8 outlets.20

ampere general-purposebranch circuitsforotherthan dwellingsshallsupply a maximum of 8

outlets.

210.22.1 Permanent Labels - Added. Permanent labelsshallbe installedto indicatethe address

or locationserved by individualmeters formulti-occupancy buildings.The permanent labels

shallbe embossed or engraved plaques,screwed or rivetedtothe servicedisconnect.

215.12.1 Color Coding; Identificationof Ungrounded Conductors - Added. Where more than

one nominal voltagesystem existsina building,each ungrounded system conductor shallbe

identifiedby phase and system as follows:

240/120 208/120 480/277 Phase

9



. • . .

Black Black Brown A

Orange Red Orange B

Blue Blue Yellow C

White White NaturalGray Neutral

Other colorsshallbe used forspecialapplications,such as travelers,etc.

220.0 Load Calculations -Added. Where an additionor alterationismade to an existing
electricalsystem, an electricalloadcalculationshallbe preparedtodetermine iftheexisting
electricalservicehas the capacitytoservetheadded load,and thecalculationshallbe made

availabletothe code officialupon request.

230.24.1 Bracketing Prohibited - Added. There shallbe no bracketingof wires totheexterior

of buildings.Weather heads shallbe so locatedthatbracketingwillnot be necessary.This

provisionshallnot apply to wires belonging to publicutilitycompanies providingserviceto

existingbuildings.

230.26.1 Point of Attachment for Overhead Services -Added. The pointof theoverhead

serviceentranceand attachment to theelectricutilitycompany's servicewires on a buildingshall

be a minimum of ten(10)feetabove theground.

Exception: For existingstructureswith overhead services,thepointof attachment shallbe not

lessthan nine (9)feetabove the ground. Clearances shallbe provided as requiredby theNational

ElectricalCode.

230.28.1 Service Masts as Supports
-Added. The minimum sizeof rigidmetal conduit(RMC)

shallbe two (2)inchforservicesup toand includingtwo hundred (200) amperes and two and

one-half(2-1/2)inchesforservicesover two hundred (200) amperes.

250.24.1 Ungrounded Systems. Constructionof new ungrounded servicesshallrequirethe

writtenspecialpermission of the code official.

250.53 (A)(2)Supplemental Electrode Required.
- Added.

250.53.1ResidentialRemodels and Repairs. A supplemental grounding electrodeshallbe

requiredforcomplete residentialrewiresand forcomplete servicechanges. Repairstoexisting
servicesthatare not replacedentirely,shallnot requirea supplemental grounding electrode

where 25ohms or lessof resistancetoearthispresent.

358.12.1 ElectricalMetallicTubing (EMT) Uses Not Permitted - Added. EMT shallnot be

installedinconcreteor underground.

422.16(B)(5) Gas-fired centralfurnaces.Gas-firedfurnacessupplyingdwelling unitsshallbe

permittedto be connected by a flexiblecord-and-plug.The cord and attachment plug shallhave

10



sufficientampacity forthe load and shallbe routedor otherwiseprotectedto preventphysical

damage to thecord or attachment plug.

505.7 (A) Implementation of Zone ClassificationSystem -
Amendatory. Classificationof

areas,engineeringand design,selectionof equipment and wiring methods shallbe performed by
a RegisteredProfessionalEngineer with expertiseinHazardous (Classified)Locationsand Zone

Systems. The installationof equipment and wiring methods, and inspectionsshallbe performed

by qualifiedpersons.

506.7 (A) Implementation of Zone ClassificationSystem - Amendatory. Classificationof

areas,engineeringand design,selectionof equipment and wiring methods shallbe performed by
a RegisteredProfessionalEngineer with expertisein Hazardous (Classified)Locationsand Zone

Systems. The installationof equipment and wiring methods, and inspectionsshallbe performed

by qualifiedpersons.

555.30 (D) Luminaires and other electricalequipment. Luminaires and electricalconnections

to luminairesor otherelectricalequipment shallbe locatednot lessthan 5 feethorizontallyfrom

thenearestnormal edge of the water.Ifa luminaireiswithinthe5 foothorizontalzone itmust be

12 feetvertically.

682.10 ElectricalEquipment and Transformers. Electricalequipment and transformers,

includingtheirenclosures,shallbe specificallyapproved forthe intendedlocation.No portionof

an enclosureforelectricalequipment not identifiedforoperationwhile submerged shallbe

locatedbelow theelectricaldatum plane.Luminaires or otherelectricalconnectionsshallbe

locatedatleast5 feet(1524 mm) horizontallyfrom the nearestedge of the water.Ifthe luminaire

iswithin5 feethorizontallyof thewater edge itmust be 12 footverticallyabove thenearestedge
of thewater.

680.23 (A)(4)Voltage Limitations.No luminariesshalloperateabove the low voltagecontact

limitas defined inSection680.2.This requirementshallapply to new installations,repair,

replacement and modificationof underwater luminaires.This sectionshallnot apply to

relamping ifthe line-voltageluminaireisprotectedby a Class A ground-faultcircuit-interrupter.

680.23.1 Underwater Luminaire(s) (Lighting)
- Added. All underwater lightingfor

swimming, wading, therapeutic,and decorativepools,fountains,hot tubs,and spas shallbe

suppliedwith not more than fourteen(14)volts.Where a plasticdeck box isused,itshallbe

installednot lessthan two (2)feetaway from thewater'sedge."

Section2. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES. That allordinances or parts of
ordinances inconflictherewith be and thesame are now expresslyrepealed.

Section 3. SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. Ifany section,sentence,clause or phrase of this

ordinance or any part thereofisfor any reason found to be invalidby a court of competent

jurisdiction,such decisionshallnot affectthe validityof the remainder of thisordinance or any

part thereof



Section 4. EMERGENCY CLAUSE. That an emergency isnow declared to existfor the

preservationof thepublicpeace, healthand safety,by reason whereof thisordinance shalltake

effectimmediatelyfrom and afteritspassage, approval and publication.

ADOPTED by the Council:
OCT 2 6 2022 .

Chair of theCotncil

ADOPTED as an emergency measure: 0CT 2 6 2022

Chair of theCounci

OFFICE OF THE MAYOR

Received by the Mayor: ,at
Date Time

G. T. Bynum, Mayor

By

Secretary

NOV 0 2 2022
APPROVED by theMayor of theCity of Tulsa,Oklahoma: ,

Date

at
Time

or

(Seal)
ATTEST:

lerk

12








