4/13/22, 1'57 PM RFA Form System ORDINANCE NO. |
24893
e | ISR
AUG 24 2022 M L
Tulsa Ci

Ordinance

Veersion 3.2 released on 8/3/21

Use for all Ordinances including: TRO, Budget, Zoning, Declarations,
Trust Indentures, etc.

Council

CITY COUNCIL USE ONLY Tracking #: CITY CLERK USE ONLY
Date 'Received: Committee: UED O Scanned Date: 08 31 D.OQLQ
Committee Date: 5 - (¥ - AR Hearing Date: . m

15( Agenda Date: T __[ 8 _)’;\ 2nd Agenda Date: g _ z 4 _22 D Posted Item #: 0 »

All department items requiring Council approval must be submitted through the Mayor's Office.
Primary Details

Dept. Tracking No. Board Approval Other Board Name City Council Approval
@®Yes ONo
Department Contact Name Emall Phone
Development Services Bob Kolibas rkolibas@qcityoftulsa.org 918-596-1612
Subject (Description) Ordinance Type
Title 56 International Plumbing Code Ordinance Amending Tulsa Revised Ordinances
Section Township Range Lot
Block Address BA / CT Number
Amending Ord. No. TRO Title No. TRO Subtitle Property/Non-Property
e.g. 43 e.9. G
Councll District Zoning No. PUD No. Planning District
!
Budget

Funding Source(s)

TOTAL:
Enter the funding source(s) using the appropriate Munis funding format: Org (Allocation Code)-Object-Amount (1001211-531401-$10.00) or Project String-Amount
(144104.AbstrTitle5413102.6001-4043122-541102-$30,000.01)

Approvals %
Department: G 0 & W 9 Date: o= ”b%
)

Legal: — et M. ShiNE Date:
Board: /o / . Date:
Mayor: Date: M
Other: 6 ; Date: )
/

Policy Statement

Background Information

Provide background information on the requested action.

Summation of the Requested Action

Updating Title 56 International Plumbing Code Ordinance for year 2018 code adoption.

Summarize the pertinent details of the requested action.

Emergency Clause? Reason for Emergency Clause
O Yes
ONo Explain why you are requesting that the City Council approve this action with an emergency clause.

apps.cityoftulsa.org/RFA/Forms/#/form/print/f4810fe4-fe39-4404-a51b-63c33229399d 1/2



'4/13/22, 1:57 PM RFA Form System

Processing Information for City Clerk's Office

Post Execution Processing Additional Routing and Processing Detalls
O Mail vendor copy (addt'l signature copies attached)

O Must be filed with other governmental entity
O Addt'l govermmental entity approval(s) required

apps.cityoftulsa.org/RFA/Forms/#/form/print/f4810fe4-fe39-4404-a51b-63c¢332a9399d

2/2



(Published in the Tulsa World,

Seotember 4 ,2022)

ORDINANCE NO. 248 93

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AND UPDATING TITLE 56 TULSA REVISED
ORDINANCES (TRO), "PLUMBING CODE"; ADOPTION OF "LC.C.
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2018 EDITION "; PROVIDING FOR
SEVERABILITY; REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT
HEREWITH; AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF TULSA:

Section 1. That Title 56, Tulsa Revised Ordinances, be and the same is hereby amended by
adopting ICC 2018 Edition amendments, to read as follows:

“Title 56 — Plumbing Code
Section 101. - Amendments to the ICC International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition.

The following sections of the ICC International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, are hereby added
or amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title - Amendatory. These regulations shall be known as the "Plumbing Code of the City
of Tulsa, Oklahoma," hereinafter referred to as the "Plumbing Code," or "this code."

102.8.3 Highest Standard Governs - Added. Nothing in this code shall be construed to prevent
the enforcement of other ordinances or local regulations which prescribe higher plumbing
standards than those which are provided herein.

102.12 Outside of City - Added. All the provisions of this code shall apply to persons, firms, or
corporations doing plumbing work outside the City of Tulsa if such work is connected or to be
connected, directly or indirectly, with the waterworks system of the City of Tulsa or to any sewer
emptying, directly or indirectly, into the sewer system of the City of Tulsa.

103.1 Authority Having Jurisdiction - Amendatory. Pursuant to Title 11, Tulsa Revised
Ordinances, Chapter 2, the Director of Planning and Development Department, or the Director's
designated representative, as provided for by Title 51, Section 103.2 Tulsa Revised Ordinances,
shall direct the administration of the Plumbing Code of the City of Tulsa.

106.1 When required - Amendatory. Any contractor who desires to construct, enlarge, alter,
repair, move, demolish or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, install,
enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any plumbing system, the installation of which
is regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be performed, shall first make application
to the code official and obtain the required permit for the work.

MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/112022



Exception. Where equipment replacements and repairs must be performed in an emergency
situation, the permit application shall be submitted within the next working business day.

106.1.1 Annual Permit - Amendatory. An annual permit is a yearly permit which represents a
group of individual permits for each alteration to an already existing electrical, gas, mechanical
or plumbing installation. The building official is authorized to issue an annual permit upon
application therefor to any person, firm or corporation regularly employing one or more qualified
tradespersons in the building, structure or on the premises owned or operated by the applicant for
the permit. )

106.1.2 Annual Permit records - Amendatory. The person to whom an annual permit is issued
shall keep a detailed record of alterations made under such annual permit. The building official
shall have access to such detailed records of alterations at all times. At the completion of the
entity's annual permit term, the applicant shall file such detailed records of alterations with the
building official. Pursuant to the authority of 59 O.S. § 1000.25, the building official shall collect
fees for each individual permit which is part of the annual permit once the detailed records are
submitted and remit such fees to the OUBCC.

106.1.3 Tulsa Revised Ordinances, Title 50 - Added. Annual permits shall be issued in
accordance with Tulsa Revised Ordinances, Title 50.

106.1.4 Separate Permit Required - Added. A separate permit shall be required for each
building within a complex and for each water meter when there is a multi-meter installation on a
single building.

106.6.1 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance - Amendatory. Any person who
commences work on a plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject
to penalty fees established in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

106.6.2 Fee Schedule - Amendatory. Permit and inspection fees for all plumbing work shall be
in accordance with the schedule established in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

106.6.3 Fee Refunds - Amendatory. Fee refunds for all plumbing work shall be in accordance
with the schedule established in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

108.4 Violation Penalties - Amendatory. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code
or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or
repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor offense, punishable by a fine of not more than One Thousand Two Hundred
Dollars ($1,200.00) or by imprisonment not exceeding six (6) months, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day, or portion thereof, that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate
offense.

108.5 Stop Work Orders - Amendatory. Upon notice from the code official, work on any
plumbing system that is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or
unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the
owner of the property, or to the owner's agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall
state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the

2
MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/11/2022



code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person
who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor offense, and, upon conviction, shall be punished by a
fine of no more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars ($1,200.00), excluding costs, fees, and
assessments, or by imprisonment for a period not exceeding six (6) months, or by both such fine
and imprisonment. Each day, or portion thereof, that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

108.8 Fine Not Exclusive Penalty - Added. The penalties herein prescribed shall not be
exclusive and shall not prevent independent action by the Board of Appeals as established by
Title 51, Chapter 1, Tulsa Revised Ordinances, to suspend or revoke the Certificate of
Registration of any person, subject to the provisions of this code, and shall not prevent the City
of Tulsa or its authorized officials from taking other action authorized by law to remedy the
violation.

SECTION 109 Means of Appeal - Amendatory. Appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the code official relative to the application and interpretation of this
code shall be made to the Board of Appeals as established by Title 51, Chapter 1, Tulsa Revised
Ordinances.

SECTION 111 Registration of Plumbing Contractors - Added.

111.1 General - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall be issued a permit, engage or offer
to engage in, by advertisement or otherwise, any plumbing business, or do any plumbing work in
the City of Tulsa, unless such person, firm, or corporation has registered with the City of Tulsa
as herein provided. All contractors, journeymen, and apprentices shall carry on their person, at
all times while performing plumbing work within the City of Tulsa, their state license and shall
display the same upon request from the code official or a police officer of the City of Tulsa.

No person issued a contractor's license shall employ or supervise persons performing plumbing
work unless those persons are licensed as provided herein. Nor shall any apprentice perform
plumbing work unless the apprentice is directly supervised by a licensed plumbing contractor or
journeyman.

111.2 Requirements for Registration - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall be issued
a Certificate of Registration until furnishing proof of a current State of Oklahoma Contractor
license, issued under the provisions of 59 0.5.2001, " 1001, et seq., as amended, and paying the
fees required by Tulsa Revised Ordinances, Title 49.

111.3 Transfer of Registration Prohibited - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall
allow his or its name to be used by any other person, firm, or corporation to obtain any permit for
or do any work under his or its Certificate of Registration.

111.4 Registration after Revocation - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall be
permitted to obtain a new Certificate of Registration within one (1) year from the date of
revocation of any prior registration.

MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/11/2022



111.5 Registration Fees - Added. Fees shall be charged for registration of state licensed
plumbing contractors, in accordance with Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

111.6 Expiration of Registration - Added. Registrations of state licensed plumbing contractors
shall expire each year on the last day of the birth month of the registered individual.

111.7 Identification of Service Vehicles - Added. Every contractor shall identify all service
vehicles used in his business with the company name and contractor's license number. Such
identification shall be placed on both sides of all vehicles in letters and numbers no less than two
(2) inches high and of a contrasting color.

111.8 Suspension or Revocation of Certificates of Registration - Added. Certificates of
Registration issued pursuant to this Code may be suspended or revoked by the Board of Appeals
in accordance with Title 51, Chapter 1, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

SECTION 202 General Definitions - Amendatory.

Building Drain - Amendatory. That part of the lowest piping of a drainage system that receives
the discharge from soil, waste, and other drainage pipes inside and that extends 5 feet (1524 mm)
in developed length of pipe beyond the exterior walls of the building and conveys the drainage to
the building sewer.

305.3 Pipes through foundation walls - Amendatory. Any pipe that passes through a
foundation wall shall be provided with a relieving arch or a pipe sleeve built into the foundation
wall. The relieving arch or pipe sleeve shall conform to one of the materials and standards listed
in Title 702.2, or as approved. The sleeve shall be two pipe sizes greater than the pipe passing
through the wall.

305.4 Freezing - Amendatory. Water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed outside of a
building, in attics or crawl spaces, concealed in outside walls, or in any other place subjected to
freezing temperatures unless adequate provision is made to protect such pipes from freezing by
insulation or heat or both. Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed not less than 6
inches (152 mm) below the frost line and not less than twenty-four (24) inches below grade.

305.6 Protection against physical damage. In concealed locations, where piping, other than cast-
iron or galvanized steel, is installed through holes or notches in studs, joists, rafters or similar
members less than 1 and onehalf inches (38 mm) from the nearest edge of the member, the pipe
shall be protected by steel shield plates. Such shield plates shall have a thickness of not less than
0.0575 inch (1.463 mm) (No. 16 gage). Such plates shall cover the area of the pipe where the
member is notched or bored, and shall extend not less than 2 inches (51 mm) above sole plates
and below top plates.

305.4.1 Sewer depth - Amendatory. Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal
systems shall be a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) below finished grade at the point of septic
tank connection or as approved by the authority having jurisdiction. Building sewer lines shall be
a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) below grade.

312.2 Drainage and Vent Water Test - Amendatory. A water test shall be applied to the
drainage system either in its entirety or in sections. If applied to the entire system, all openings in

MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/11/2022



the piping shall be tightly closed, except the highest opening, and the system shall be filled with
water to the point of overflow. If the system is tested in sections, each opening shall be tightly
plugged except the highest openings of the section under test, and each section shall be filled
with water, but no section shall be tested with less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of water. In
testing successive sections, at least the upper 5 feet (1524 mm) of the next preceding section
shall be tested so that no joint or pipe in the building, except the uppermost 5 feet (1524 mm) of
the system, shall have been submitted to a test of less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of water.
This pressure shall be held for at least 15 minutes. The system shall then be tight at all points.

312.3 Drainage and vent air test - Amendatory. Plastic piping shall not be tested using air. An
air test shall be made by forcing air into the system until there is a uniform gauge pressure of 2.5
psi (17.25 kPa) or sufficient to balance a 5-inch (127 mm) column of mercury. This test shall be
held for a period of not less than 15 minutes. Any adjustments to the test pressure required
because of changes in ambient temperatures or the seating of gaskets shall be made prior to the
beginning of the test period.

312.6 Gravity Sewer Test - Amendatory. Where required, gravity sewer tests shall consist of
plugging the end of the building sewer at the point of connection with the public sewer, filling

the building sewer with water, testing with not less than a 5-foot (1024 mm) head of water and
maintaining such pressure for 15 minutes.

312.10.1 Inspections - Amendatory. Annual inspections shall be made of all backflow
assemblies and air gaps to determine whether they are operable, in accordance with Chapter 1,
Section 104.3 and 105.3.2.

314.2.1 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils and evaporators shall be
conveyed from the drain pain outlet to an approved place of disposal. Such piping shall maintain
a horizontal slope in the direction of discharge of not less than one-eighth unit vertical in 12 units
horizontal (1-percent slope). Condensate drains shall be allowed to terminate to an approved pit
or French drain consisting of a minimum of 24 inches by 24 inches by 24 inches (610 mm by
610 mm by 610 mm), or equivalent; of 1 inch (25 mm) washed rock. Such pits or French drains
shall be located 30 inches (762 mm) minimum from outer edge of foundation to nearest edge of
pit or French drain. Condensate shall not discharge into a street, alley or other areas so as to
cause a nuisance

314.2.3.1 Water-level monitoring devices. On down-flow units and all other coils that do not
have a secondary drain or provisions to install a secondary or auxiliary drain pan, a water-level
monitoring device shall be installed inside the primary drain pan. This device shall shut off the
equipment served in the event that the primary drain becomes restricted. Devices installed in the
drain line shall not be permitted. Exception: This section shall not apply to appliances installed in
areas outside on the ground or elevated structure where condensate overflow will not damage
building components or contents.

403.4.1 Directional signage. Directional signage indicating the route to the required public toilet
facilities in Group A, B, I, M, and R-1 occupancies shall be posted in a lobby, corridor, or aisle,
or similar space, such that the sign can be readily seen from the main entrance to the building or
tenant space. Only one sign at each main entrance that is intended for public use shall be
required. Exceptions: (A) Group A occupancies that are part of an overall Group E occupancy

5
MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/112022



need not have directional signage. (B) Private-use Group B occupancies need not have
directional signage.

405.9 Slip Joint Connections - Amendatory. Slip joints shall be made with an approved
elastomeric gasket and shall only be installed from fixture outlet to within 18 inches (457 mm)
downstream of trap outlet seal. Fixtures with concealed slip-joint connections shall be provided
with an access panel or utility space at least 12 inches (305 mm) in its smallest dimension or
other approved arrangement so as to provide access to the slip joint connections for inspection
and repair.

408.2 Water connection. The water supply to a bidet shall be protected against backflow by an
air gap or backflow preventer in accordance with Section 608.14.1, 608.14.2, 608.14.3, 608.14.5,
or 608.14.6.

410.4 Substitution. Where restaurants provide drinking water in a container free of charge,
drinking fountains shall not be required in those restaurants. In occupancy Group B, F, M, I-4
and S, with an occupant load less than 50, where drinking fountains are required, a water
dispenser connected to the potable water distribution system shall be permitted to be substituted
for the required drinking fountain. In occupancies other than restaurants where drinking
fountains are required, water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than 50
percent of the required number of drinking fountains.

604.5 Size of fixture supply - Amendatory. The minimum size of a fixture supply pipe shall be
as shown in Table 604.5. The fixture supply pipe shall terminate not more than 30 inches (762
mm) from the point of connection to the fixture. A reduced size flexible water connector
installed between the supply pipe and the fixture shall be of an approved type. The supply pipe
shall extend to the floor or wall adjacent to the fixture. The minimum size of individual
distribution lines utilized in gridded or parallel water distribution systems shall be as shown in
Table 604.5

Exception: The fixture supply pipe for domestic dishwashers and drinking fountains shall be
permitted to be terminated more than 30 inches (762 mm) from the point of connection to the
fixture.

608.16.4 Protection by a vacuum breaker. Openings and outlets shall be protected by
atmospheric-type or pressure-type vacuum breakers. The vacuum breaker has a critical level
installation height of not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the highest elevation of
downstream piping and flood level rim of the fixture of device. Fill valves shall be set in
accordance with Section 415.3.1. Vacuum breakers shall not be installed under exhaust hoods or
similar locations 10 that will contain toxic fumes or vapors. Pipe applied vacuum breakers shall
be installed not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above the flood level rim of the fixture, receptor, or
device served.

608.17.5 Connections to Lawn Irrigation Systems - Amendatory. The potable water supply to
lawn irrigation systems shall be protected against backflow by an atmospheric-type vacuum
bfeaker, a pressure-type vacuum breaker assembly, a spill resistant backflow preventer or a
reduced pressure principle backflow preventer. A valve shall not be installed downstream from
an atmospheric vacuum breaker. Where chemicals are introduced into the system, the potable

6
MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/11R022



water supply shall be protected against backflow by a reduced pressure principle backflow
preventer assembly.

701.2.1 Public System Availability - Added. Availability of the public sewer system to any
premise shall be determined by the Development Services Division of the City of Tulsa.

705.10.2 Solvent cementing. Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from moisture. A purple
primer that conforms to ASTM F 656 shall be applied. Solvent cement not purple in color and
conforming to ASTM D 2564, CSA B137.3, CSA B181.2 or CSA B182.1 shall be applied to all
joint surfaces. The joint shall be made while the cement is wet and shall be in accordance with
ASTM D 2855. Solvent-cement joints shall be permitted above or below ground.

705.10.2 Solvent Cementing - Amendatory. Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from
moisture. A purple primer that conforms to ASTM F 656 shall be applied. Solvent cement not
purple in color and conforming to ASTM D 2564, CSA B137.3, CSA B181.2 or CSA B182.1
shall be applied to all joint surfaces. The joint shall be made while the cement is wet and shall be
in accordance with ASTM D 2855. Solvent-cement joints shall be permitted above or below
ground.

708.1.3 Building Drain and Building Sewer Junction - Amendatory. The junction of the
building drain and the building sewer shall be served by a cleanout that is located at the junction
or within 12 feet (3658 mm) of the developed length of piping upstream of the junction. For the
requirements of this section, the removal of the water closet shall not be required to provide
cleanout access.

801.1 Scope, Exception—Food Handling - Added. Section 801.1 of the ICC International
Plumbing Code, 2018 edition, is amended to provide the following exception: Plumbing in all
food handling facilities shall comply with Title 17, Tulsa Revised Ordinances, Tulsa City County
Health Department Food Code and meet the Inspection Code.

802.1 Where required. Foodhandling equipment, in other than dwelling units, clear-water waste,
humidifiers, dishwashing machines and utensils, pots, pans and dishwashing sinks shall
discharge through an indirect waste pipe as specified in Sections 802.1.1 through 802.1.7.
Fixtures not required to be indirectly connected by this section and the exception to Section
301.6 shall be directly connected to the plumbing system in accordance with Chapter 7.

903.1 Roof Extension - Amendatory. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be
terminated not less than 10 inches (254 mm) above the roof. Where a roof is to be used for
assembly or as a promenade, observation deck, sun bathing deck or similar purposes open vent
pipes shall terminate not less than 7 feet (2134 mm) above the finished occupiable surface within
10 feet (3048 mm) horizontal distance.

919.1 General. Engineered vent systems shall comply with this section and the design, submittal,
approval, inspection and testing requirements of Section 316.

1003.4 Oil Separators required - Amendatory. At repair garages where floor or trench drains
are provided, car washing facilities, factories where oily and flammable liquid wastes are
produced and hydraulic elevator pits, oil separators shall be installed into which oil-bearing,

MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/11/2022




grease-bearing or flammable wastes shall be discharged before emptying into the building
drainage system or other point of disposal.

Exceptions:

(1)  An oil separator is not required in hydraulic elevator pits where an approved alarm
system is installed. Such alarm systems shall not terminate the operation of pumps
utilized to maintain emergency operation of the elevator by fire fighters.

(2) Oil separators shall not be required in a non-hydraulic elevator pit.

1101.7 Roof design - Amendatory. Roofs shall be designed for the maximum possible depth of
water that will pond thereon as determined by the relative levels of roof deck and overflow
weirs, scuppers, edges or serviceable drains in combination with the deflected structural
elements. In determining the maximum possible depth of water, all primary roof drainage means
shall be assumed to be blocked. The maximum possible depth of water on the roof shall include
the height of the water required above the inlet of the secondary roof drainage means to achieve
the required flow rate of secondary drainage means to accommodate the design rainfall rate as
required by Section 1108.

1101.9 Backwater valves. Storm drainage systems shall be provided with backwater valves as
required for sanitary drainage systems in accordance with Section 714.

TABLE 1108.1 SIZE OF SECONDAIRY SCUPPERS FOR A 10.2 — INCH PER HOUR
RATE OF RAINFALL

HORIZONTALLY PROJECTED ROOF AREA

(SQUARE FEET)
HII':NAD LENGTH OF WEIR IN INCHES
INCHES 4 6 8 12 16 | 20 24
1 112 169 226 339 452 565 678

21 314 471 628 942 1256 1571 1885
3 565 848 1130 1696 2262 2828 3393
4| 879 1319 1759 2637 3519 4399 5279
For SI: 1 inch =254

Notes:

1. To adjust this table for other than a 10.2-inch design rainfall rate multiply the square
footage on the table by 10.2 then divide by the design rainfall rate.

2. This table does not apply to scuppers with a vertical opening height that is less than the
head height.

Example: For 4 inches of design rainfall rate, a 4 - inch longer scupper with a 1 - inch head
would accommodate 286 square feet. (112 X 10.2) / 4 = 286.

8
MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/112022



1108.3 Sizing of Secondary Drains - Amendatory. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems
and emergency scuppers shall be sized in accordance with Section 1106 except the design shall
be based on a rainfall rate of 10.2 inches per hour. Scuppers shall be sized to prevent the depth of
ponding water from exceeding that for which the roof was designed as determined by Section
1101.7. Scuppers shall not have an opening dimension of less than 4 inches (102 mm). The flow
through the primary system shall not be considered when sizing the secondary roof drain system
or secondary scuppers.

1301.9.5 Overflow - Amendatory. The storage tank shall be equipped with an overflow pipe
having a diameter not less than that shown in Table 606.5.4. The overflow pipe shall be
protected from insects or vermin and shall discharge in a manner consistent with storm water
runoff requirements of the jurisdiction. The overflow pipe shall discharge at a sufficient distance
from the tank to avoid damaging the tank foundation or the adjacent property. Drainage from
overflow pipes shall be directed to prevent freezing on walkways. The overflow drain shall not
be equipped with a shutoff valve. A cleanout shall be provided on each overflow pipe in
accordance with Section 708.

IPC® 2018 Chapter 15 Referenced Standards - Amendatory. Chapter 15 of the IPC 2018 is
adopted with the following modifications:

IBC® 18 International Building Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma
through the OUBCC.

IECC®-06 International Energy Conservation Code®

IFC® 18 International Fire Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through
the OUBCC.

IMC® 18 International Mechanical Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma
through the OUBCC.

IFGC® 18 International Fuel Gas Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma
through the OUBCC.

IRC® 15 International Residential Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma
through the OUBCC.

NFPA 70-14 National Electrical Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma
through OUBCC.

ANSI A118.10-99 Specifications for Load Bearing, Bonded, Waterproof Membranes for Thin
Set Ceramic Tile and Dimension Stone Installation. 421.5.2.5, 421.5.2.6.

TCNA/ANSI A118.10-99: Specifications for Load Bearing, Bonded, Waterproof Membranes for
Thin Set Ceramic Tile and Dimension Stone Installation referenced in Sections 421.5.2.5 and
421.5.2.6 has been stricken from the code.”

Section 2. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES. That all ordinances or parts of
ordinances in conflict herewith be and the same are now expressly repealed.

MDS/jam #56 2018 Code Adopted
4/112022



Section 3. SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this
ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason found to be invalid by a court of competent

Jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remainder of this ordinance or any
part thereof.

Section 4. EMERGENCY CLAUSE. That an emergency is now declared to exist for the
preservation of the public peace, health and safety, by reason whereof this ordinance shall take
effect immediately from and afier its passage, approval and publication.

ADOPTED by the Council: AUG24 202 .

Date -

A sk Tephos

Chair of the Cdodncil

ADOPTED as an emergency measure: {AUG 2 ‘ 20

Chair of the Coudcil

OFFICE OF THE MAYOR

Received by the Mayor: , at
Date Time

G. T. Bynum, Mayor

4

Secretary

APPROVED by the Mayor of the City of Tulsa, Oklahoma: AVG 31

Date
at
Time
\J Mayor
10
MDS/jam

#56 2018 Code Adopted
4/11/2022



(Seal)

ATTEST:

(/ k-—efff Clerk

APPROVED:

C7‘{%(3\(\/,:\

\)ity Attorney

MDS/jam

11

#56 2018 Code Adopted
4/1172022



Title 56 — Plumbing Code

Section 101. - Amendments to the ICC International Plumbing Code, 2835 2018 Edition. _, .- ‘[ro,—maned; Strikethrough
The following sections of the ICC International Plumbing Code, 2046 2018Edition,_are hereby addedor_ _ _ _ - ‘[Formaned: Strikethrough

amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title - Amendatory. These regulations shall be known as the "Plumbing Code of the City of Tulsa,
Oklahoma," hereinafter referred to as the "Plumbing Code," or "this code.”

102.8.3 Highest Standard Governs - Added. Nothing in this code shall be construed to prevent the
enforcement of other ordinances or local regulations which prescribe higher plumbing standards than
those which are provided herein.

102.12 Qutside of City - Added. All the provisions of this code shall apply to persons, firms, or
corporations doing plumbing work outside the City of Tulsa if such work is connected or to be connected,
directly or indirectly, with the waterworks system of the City of Tulsa or to any sewer emptying, directly or
indirectly, into the sewer system of the City of Tulsa.

103.1 Authority Having Jurisdiction - Amendatory. Pursuant to Title 11, Tulsa Revised Ordinances,
Chapter 2, the Director of Planning and Development Departrent, or the Director's designated
representative, as provided for by Title 51, Section 103.2 Tulsa Revised Ordinances, shall direct the
administration of the Plumbing Code of the City of Tulsa.

106.1 When required - Amendatory. Any contractor who desires to construct, enlarge, alter, repair,
move, demolish or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, install, enlarge, alter,
repair, remove, convert or replace any plumbing system, the installation of which is regulated by this
code, or to cause any such work to be performed, shall first make application to the code official and
obtain the required permit for the work

Exception. Where equipment replacements and repairs must be perforrmed in an emergency situation,
the permit application shall be submitted within the next working business day

106.1.1 Annual Permit - Amendatory. An annual permit is a yearly permit which represents a group of
individual permits for each alteration to an already existing electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
installation. The building official is authorized to issue an annual permit upon application therefor to any
person, firm or corporation regularly employing one or more qualified tradespersons in the building,
structure or on the premises owned or operated by the applicant for the permit.

106.1.2 Annual Permit records - Amendatory. The person to whom an annual permit is issued shall
keep a detailed record of alterations made under such annual permit The building official shalt have
access o such detailed records of alterations at all times At the completion of the entity's annual permit
term, the applicant shall file such detailed records of alterations with the building official. Pursuant to the
authority of 58 O.S § 1000 25, the building official shall collect fees for each individual permit which is
part of the annual permit once the detailed records are submitted and remit such fees to the OUBCC.

106.1.3 Tulsa Revised Ordinances, Title 50 - Added. Annual permits shall be issued in accordance with
Tulsa Revised Ordinances, Title 50.

106.1.4 Separate Permit Required - Added. A separate permit shali be required for each building within
a complex and for each water meter when there is a multi-meter installation on a single building.

106.6.1 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance - Amendatory. Any person who commences work
on a plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to penalty fees established
in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.



106.6.2 Fee Schedule - Amendatory. Permit and inspection fees for all plumbing work shall be in
accordance with the schedule established in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

106.6.3 Fee Refunds - Amendatory. Fee refunds for all plumbing work shall be in accordance with the
schedule established in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

108.4 Violation Penalties - Amendatory. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, aiter or repair plumbing work
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor offense, punishable
by a fine of not more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars ($1,200.00) or by imprisonment not
exceeding six (6) months, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day, or portion thereof, that a
violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense

108.5 Stop Work Orders - Amendatory. Upon notice from the code official, work on any plumbing
system that is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall
immediately cease. Such notice shall be in wnting and shall be given to the owner of the property, or to
the owner's agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work
is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be regquired to give a
written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure
after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person Is directed to perform to
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor offense, and, upon conviction,
shall be punished by a fine of no more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars ($1,200.00), excluding
costs, fees, and assessments, or by impnsonment for a penod not exceeding six (6) months, or by both
such fine and imprisonment Each day, or portion thereof, that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

108.8 Fine Not Exclusive Penalty - Added. The penalties herein prescribed shall not be exclusive and
shall not prevent independent action by the Board of Appeals as established by Title 51, Chapter 1, Tulsa
Revised Ordinances, to suspend or revoke the Certificate of Registration of any person, subject to the
provisions of this code, and shall not prevent the City of Tulsa or its authorized officials from taking other
action authorized by law to remedy the violation.

SECTION 109 Means of Appeal - Amendatory. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the code official relative to the application and interpretation of this code shall be made to the Board of
Appeals as established by Title 51, Chapter 1, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

SECTION 111 Registration of Plumbing Contractors - Added.

111.1 General - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall be 1ssued a permit, engage or offer to
engage In, by advertisement or otherwise, any plumbing business, or do any plumbing work in the City of
Tulsa, unless such person, firm, or corporation has registered with the City of Tulsa as herein provided.
All contractors, journeymen, and apprentices shalt carry on their person, at all times while performing
plumbing work within the City of Tulsa, their state license and shall display the same upon request from
the code official or a police officer of the City of Tulsa.

No person issued a contractor's license shall employ or supervise persons performing plumbing work
unless those persons are licensed as provided herein. Nor shall any apprentice perform plumbing work
unless the apprentice is directly supervised by a licensed plumbing contractor or journeyman.

111.2 Requirements for Registration - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall be issued a
Certificate of Registration until fumishing proof of a current State of Oklahoma Contractor license, issued
under the provisions of 59 0.5.2001, " 1001, et seq., as amended, and paying the fees required by Tulsa
Revised Ordinances, Title 49



111.3 Transfer of Registration Prohibited - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall allow his or its
name to be used by any other person, firm, or corporation to obtain any permit for or do any work under
his or its Certificate of Registration.

111.4 Registration after Revocation - Added. No person, firm, or corporation shall be permitted to
obtain a new Certificate of Registration within one (1) year from the date of revocation of any pnor
registration

111.5 Registration Fees - Added. Fees shall be charged for registration of state licensed plumbing
contractors, in accordance with Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances

111.6 Expiration of Registration - Added. Registrations of state licensed plumbing contractors shall
expire each year on the last day of the birth month of the registered individual.

111.7 Identification of Service Vehicles - Added. Every contractor shall identify all service vehicles
used in his business with the company name and contractor's license number. Such identification shall be
placed on both sides of all vehicles in letters and numbers no less than two (2) inches high and of a
contrasting color.

111.8 Suspension or Revocation of Certificates of Registration - Added. Certificates of Registration
issued pursuant to this Code may be suspended or revoked by the Board of Appeals in accordance with
Title 51, Chapter 1, Tulsa Revised Ordinances.

SECTION 202 General Definitions - Amendatory.

Building Drain - Amendatory. That part of the lowest piping of a drainage system that receives the
discharge from soil, waste, and other drainage pipes inside and that extends 5 feet (1524 mm) in
developed length of pipe beyond the exterior walls of the building and conveys the drainage to the
building sewer.

305.3 Pipes through foundation walls - Amendatory. Any pipe that passes through a foundation wall
shall be provided with a relieving arch or a pipe sleeve built into the foundation wall. The relieving arch or
pipe sleeve shall conform to one of the matenals and standards listed in Title 702.2, or as approved The
sleeve shall be two pipe sizes greater than the pipe passing through the wall.

305.4 Freezing - Amendatory. Water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed outside of a building, in
attics or crawl spaces, concealed in outside walls, or in any other place subjected to freezing
temperatures unless adequate provision is made to protect such pipes from freezing by insulation or heat
or both. Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed not less than 6 inches (152 mm) below the
frost line and not less than twenty-four (24} inches below grade

305.6 Protection against physical damage. In concealed locations, where piping, other than cast-iron or
galvanized steel. is installed through holes or notches in studs, joists, rafters or similar members less than

1 and onehalf inches (38 mm) from the nearest edge of the member, the pipe shall be protected by steel
shield plates. Such shield plates shall have a thickness of not less than 0.0575 inch {(1.463 mm) (No. 16

qage) Such plates shall cover the area of the pipe where the member is notched or bored, and shall
extend not less than 2 inches (51 mm) above sole plates and below top plates.

305.4.1 Sewer depth - Amendatory. Building sewers that connect to pnvate sewage disposal systems
shall be a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection or
as approved by the authonty having jurisdiction. Building sewer lines shall be a minimum of 12 inches
(305 mm) below grade.

312.2 Drainage and Vent Water Test - Amendatory. A water test shall be applied to the drainage
system either in its entirety or in sections. If applied to the entire system, all openings in the piping shall
be tightly closed, except the highest opening, and the system shall be filled with water to the point of
overflow. If the system is tested in sections, each opening shall be tightly plugged except the highest




openings of the section under test, and each section shall be filled with water, but no section shall be i
tested with less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of water In testing successive sections, at least the upper
5 feet (1524 mm) of the next preceding section shall be tested so that no joint or pipe in the buitding,
except the uppermost 5 feet (1524 mm) of the system, shall have been submitted to a test of less than a
5-foot (1524 mm) head of water. This pressure shal! be held for at least 15 minutes The system shall :
then be tight at all points.

312.3 Drainage and vent air test - Amendatory. Plastic piping shall not be tested using air. An air test
shall be made by forcing air into the system until there is a uniform gauge pressure of 2.5 psi (17.25 kPa)
or sufficient to balance a 5-inch (127 mm) column of mercury. This test shall be held for a period of not
less than 15 minutes. Any adjustments to the test pressure required because of changes in ambient ;
temperatures or the seating of gaskets shall be made prior to the beginning of the test period

312.6 Gravity Sewer Test - Amendatory. Where required, gravity sewer tests shall consist of plugging :
the end of the building sewer at the point of connection with the public sewer, filling the building sewer

with water, testing with not less than a 5-foot (1024 mm) head of water and maintaining such pressure for

15 minutes.

312.10.1 Inspections - Amendatory. Annual inspections shall be made of all backflow assemblies and
air gaps to determine whether they are operable, in accordance with Chapter 1, Section 104 3 and
105.3.2.

314 2.1 Condensate disposal Condensate from all cooling coils and evaporators shall be conveyed from
the drain pain outlet to an approved place of disposal. Such piping shail maintain a_ honzontal slope in the
direction of discharge of not less than one-eighth unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1-percent slope).
Condensate drains shall be allowed to terminate to an approved pit or French drain consisting of a
minimum of 24 inches by 24 inches by 24 inches (610 mm by 610 mm by 610 mm), or equivalent; of 1
inch (25 mm) washed rock. Such pits or French drains shall be located 30 inches (762 mm) minimum
from outer edqe of foundation to nearest edge of pit or French drain Condensate shall not discharge into
a street, alley or other areas so as to cause a nuisance

314.2.3.1 Water-level monitoring devices. On down-flow units and all other coils that do not have a
secondary drain or provisions to install a secondary or auxiliary drain pan, a water-level monitoring device
shall be installed inside the primary drain pan This device shall shut off the equipment served in the
event that the primary drain becomes restricted Devices installed in the drain line shall not be permitted
Exception: This section shall not apply to appliances installed in areas outside on the ground or elevated
structure where condensate overflow will not damage building components or contents.

403.4.1 Directiona! signage. Directional signage indicating the route to the required public toilet facilities
in Group A, B, I, M, and R-1 occupancies shall be posted in a lobby, corridor, or aisle, or similar space,
such that the sign can be readily seen from the main entrance to the building or tenant space Only one
sign at each main entrance that 1s intended for public use shall be required. Exceptions: (A) Group A
occupancies that are part of an overall Group E occupancy need not have directional signage. (B)
Pnvate-use Group B occupancies need not have directional signage.

elastomeric gasket and shall only be installed from fixture outlet to within 18 inches (457 mm)
downstream of trap outlet seal Fixtures with concealed slip-joint connections shall be provided with an
access panel or utility space at least 12 inches (305 mm) in its smallest dimension or other approved
arrangement so as to provide access to the slip joint connections for inspection and repair.

408.2 Water connection. The water supply to a bidet shall be protected against backfiow by an air gap or
backflow preventer in accordance with Section 608.14.1, 608 14.2, 608 14 3, 608.14.5 or 608 14.6.

410 4 Substitution. Where restaurants provide drinking water in a container free of charge, drinking
fountaing shall not be required in those restaurants In occupancy Group B, F, M, |-4 and S, with an
occupant load less than 50, where dnnking fountains are required, a water dispenser connected to the

- ‘[Formaﬁed: Strikethrough




potable water distribution system shall be permitted to be substituted for the required drinking fountain_In
occupancies other than restaurants where drinking fountains are required, water dispensers shall be
permitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the required number of drinking fountains.

604.5 Size of fixture supply - Amendatory. The minimum size of a fixture supply pipe shall be as shown
in Table 604.5. The fixture supply pipe shall terminate not more than 30 inches (762 mm) from the point
of connection to the fixture. A reduced size flexible water connector installed between the supply pipe and
the fixture shall be of an approved type. The supply pipe shall extend to the floor or wall adjacent to the
fixture. The minimum size of individual distribution lines utilized in gridded or parallel water distribution
systems shall be as shown in Table 604.5

Exception: The fixture supply pipe for domestic dishwashers and drinking fountains shali be permitted to
be terminated more than 30 inches (762 mm) from the point of connection to the fixture.

608.16.4 Protection by a vacuum breaker. Openings and outlets shall be protected by atmospheric-type
or pressure-type vacuum breakers The vacuum breaker has a critical level installation height of not less
than 12 inches (305 mm) above the highest elevation of downstream piping and flood level rim of the
fixture of device. Fill valves shall be set in accordance with Section 415.3.1. Vacuum breakers shail not
be installed under exhaust hoods or similar lacations 10 that will contain toxic fumes or vapors Pipe
applied vacuum breakers shall be installed not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above the flood level rim of
the fixture receptor, or device served.

508-16-6 608.17.5 Connections to Lawn Irrigation Systems - Amendatory. The potable water supply _ _

to lawn irrigation systems shall be protected against backfiow by an atmosphenc-type vacuum breaker, a
pressure-type vacuum breaker assembly, a spill resistant backflow preventer or a reduced pressure
principle backflow preventer. A valve shall not be installed downstream from an atmospheric vacuum
breaker. Where chemicals are introduced into the system, the potable water supply shall be protected
against backflow by a reduced pressure principle backfiow preventer assembly.

701.2.1 Public System Availability - Added. Availability of the public sewer system to any premise shall
be determined by the Development Services Division of the City of Tulsa.

705.10.2 Solvent cementing Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from moisture. A purple primer that
conforms to ASTM F 656 shall be applied Solvent cement not purple in color and conforming to ASTM D
2564, CSA B137 3, CSA B181.2 or CSA B182.1 shall be applied to all joint surfaces. The joint shall be
made while the cement is wet and shall be in accordance with ASTM D 2855. Solvent-cement joints shall
be permitted above or below ground.

F65-41-2 705.10.2 Solvent Cementing - Amendatory. Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from

moisture. A purple primer that conforms to ASTM F 656 shall be applied. Solvent cement not purple in
color and conforming to ASTM D 2564, CSA B137.3, CSA B181 2 or CSA B182.1 shall be applied to all
joint surfaces. The joint shall be made while the cement is wet and shalt be in accordance with ASTM D
2855. Solvent-cement joints shall be permitted above or below ground

708.1.3 Building Drain and Building Sewer Junction - Amendatory. The junction of the building drain
and the building sewer shall be served by a cleanout that is located at the junction or within 12 feet (3658
mm) of the developed length of piping upstream of the junction. For the requirements of this section, the
removal of the water closet shall not be required to provide cleanout access.

Food Code and meet the Inspection Code.

802 1 Where required. Foodhandling equipment, in other than dwelling units, clear-water waste
humidifiers, dishwashing machines and utensils, pots, pans and dishwashing sinks shall discharge
through an indirect waste pipe as specified in Sections 802.1 1 through 802 1.7 Fixtures not required to

.- ‘[Formatted: Strikethrough

1

'

- ‘{Formaned: Strikethrough




be indirectly connected by this section and the exception to Section 301 6 shall be directly connected to
the plumbing system in accordance with Chapter 7.

903.1 Roof Extension - Amendatory. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated
not less than 10 inches (254 mm) above the roof. Where a roof is to be used for assembly or as a
promenade, observation deck, sun bathing deck or similar purposes open vent pipes shall terminate not
less than 7 feet (2134 mm) above the finished occupiable surface within 10 feet (3048 mm) horizontal
distance.

919 1 General Engineered vent systems shall comply with this section and the design, submittal
approval, inspection and testing requirements of Section 316.

1003.4 Oil Separators required - Amendatory. At repair garages where floor or trench drains are
provided, car washing facilities, factories where oily and flammable liquid wastes are produced and
hydraulic elevator pits, oil separators shall be installed into which oil-bearing, grease-beanng or
flammable wastes shall be discharged before emptying into the building drainage system or other point of
disposal.

Exceptions:

(1) An oil separator is not required in hydraulic elevator pits where an approved alarm system is
installed. Such alarm systems shall not terminate the operation of pumps utilized to maintain
emergency operation of the elevator by fire fighters

(2) Ol separators shall not be required in a non-hydraulic elevator pit.

1101.7 Roof design - Amendatory. Roofs shall be designed for the maximum possible depth of water
that will pond thereon as determined by the relative levels of roof deck and overflow weirs, scuppers,
edges or serviceable drains in combination with the deftected structural elements. In determining the
maximum possible depth of water, all pnmary roof drainage means shall be assumed to be blocked. The
maximum possible depth of water on the roof shall include the height of the water required above the inlet
of the secondary roof drainage means to achieve the required flow rate of secondary drainage means to
accommodate the design rainfall rate as required by Section 1108.

1101.9 Backwater valves. Storm drainage systems shall be provided with backwater valves as required
for sanitary drainage systems in accordance with Section 714.

TABLE 1108.1 SIZE OF SECONDAIRY SCUPPERS FOR A 10.2 — INCH PER HOUR RATE OF RAINFALL

] HORIZONTALLY PROJECTED ROOF AREA (SQUARE FEET)
%:\D LENGTH OF WEIR IN INCHES
INCHES 4 6 8 12 16 20 24
i1 112 169 226 339 452 565 678
2| 314 a71 628 942 1256 1571 1885
3| s6s 848 1130 1696 2262 2828 3393
4| 879 1319 1759 2637 3519 4399 527

ForSi:1inch=254



Notes:

1. To adjust this table for other than a 10.2-inch design rainfall rate multiply the square footage on
the table by 10.2 then divide by the design rainfall rate.

2. This table does not apply to scuppers with a vertical opening height that is less than the head
height.

Example: For 4 inches of design rainfall rate, a 4 - inch longer scupper with a 1 - inch head would \
accommodate 286 square feet. (112 X 10.2) /4 = 286.

1108.3 Sizing of Secondary Drains - Amendatory. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems and
emergency scuppers shall be sized in accordance with Section 1106 except the design shall be based on
a rainfall rate of 10.2 inches per hour. Scuppers shall be sized to prevent the depth of ponding water from
exceeding that for which the roof was designed as determined by Section 1101.7. Scuppers shall not
have an opening dimension of less than 4 inches (102 mm). The flow through the pnmary system shall
not be considered when sizing the secondary roof drain system or secondary scuppers

having a diameter not less than that shown in Table 606.5.4. The overflow pipe shall be protected from
insects or vermin and shall discharge 1n a manner consistent with storm water runoff requirements of the
jurisdiction. The overflow pipe shall discharge at a sufficient distance from the tank to avoid damaging the
tank foundation or the adjacent property. Drainage from overflow pipes shall be directed to prevent

freezing on walkways. The overflow drain shall not be equipped with a shutoff valve. A cleanout shall be ,
provided on each overflow pipe in accordance with Section 708.

IPC® 2015 2018 Chapter 15 Referenced Standards - Amendatory. Chapter 15 of the IPC 2846 2018is __

adopted with the following modifications: )

ouscc
IECC®-06 International Energy Conservation Code®
IFC®-16_18 International Fire Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the

A e L o e e O e O Y e e Y e s M P e e e —

the OUBCC :

the OUBCC. ‘

NFPA 70-14 National Electrical Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through
OouBCC.

ANSI A118 10-99 Specifications for Load Beanng, Bonded, Waterproof Membranes for Thin Set Ceramic
Tile and Dimension Stone Installation. 421 5.2.5, 421.5.2.6.

TCNAJANSI A118.10-99: Specifications for Load Bearing, Bonded, Waterproof Membranes for Thin Set
Ceramic Tile and Dimension Stone Installation referenced in Sections 421.5.2.5 and 421.5.2.6 has been
stricken from the code

- ‘[Formaned:

Strikethrough

- ‘[Formaned:

Strikethrough

) ‘[Formaned:

Strikethrough

- ‘{Formaned:

Strikethrough

- ’[Formaned:

Strikethrough

- ’{Formaned:

Strikethrough

-—— ‘{Formaned:

Strikethrough

: Strikethrough




(Ord. Nos. 17796, 18096, 18171, 18370, 19011, 20066, 20428, 20631, 20895, 21237; Ord. No.
21990, § 1, 1-16-2009; Ord. No. 22757, § 1, 9-20-2012; Ord. No. 23003, § 1, 12-12-2013; Ord.
No. 23398, § 1, 10-29-2015)

TITLE 57 - REFRIGERATION CODE (REPEALED)

m

Footnotes:
- {1) -

Note— This title was repealed by the Mechanical Equipment Code, Title 59, effective August 1, 1966.
TITLE 58 - ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE (REPEALED)

4]}
Footnotes:
(1) -

Note— This title was repealed by Ordinance No. 16161, enacted on October 12, 1964
TITLE 59 - MECHANICAL CODE

w

Footnotes:

(1) -

Editor's note— Ord. No 23436, § 1, adopted February 11, 2016 , amended Title 59 in its entirety to read

as herein set out Former Title 59, Chs, 1—3, §§ 100, 101, 200, 201, 300, 301, pertained to International

- ‘[Formatted: Strikethrough

) ‘[ Formatted: Strikethrough



CITY OF TULSA

Atin City Clerk’s Office

175 E. 2ND ST. SUITE 260
TULSA, OK 74103

TULSA WORLD

P.0.Box 1770  Tulsa, Gklahoma 741021770 tulsaworld.com

Account Nu:mber

1 03093!%

[ ol ]

September 08, 2022

S }

Category

r Date

Description Ad Size TotaIEl:osl I

09/08/2022

Legal Notices

0}
24893 2x613.00CL 1784.64

Affidavit of Publication

1, Brenda Brumbaugh
legal representative of the Tulsa World of Tulsa, Oklahoma, a
daily newspaper ofgcncral circulation in Tulsa County,
Oklahoma, a legal newspaper. quallfcd to publish legal
notices, as defined in 25 O.S. § 106 as amended, and
thereafier, and complies with all other requircments of the
laws of Oklahoma with reference to legal publication. That
said notice, a true copy of which is attached hereto, was
published in the regular edition of said newspaper during the
period and time of publication and not in a supplement, on th
DATE(S) LISTED BELOW

, of lawful age, am a

09/08/2022

Newspaper reference: 0000774731

Legal Representative

i 62/0&/;24

Sworn to and subscribed before me this dn.te:

N co e T AMBER SHELL
=" - -| NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF OX(AHOMA
my commssnon EXPIRES SERY 11, 2023

& 997

My Cc ion expires




ERIE sl B e | O 0 SRERMIIIS 8 saeennt gt g 1 s
g:ziai ’gggii § i:zﬁ;?gé; 2 §;§gggggiigg?g,gn§§§ 2 i 355%3:35!’; i “E i % i
%agﬁﬁjéﬁg%ﬁfﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁmhnagE;ﬂiﬁﬁﬂﬁ§ fgc g
it ggga;g i z§;§§§r . Jaézg;;gasé;gzgéf i %ﬁ;;; L
il ﬂhi R R (T
§5§%§§i it is s b 53;i§"§i§%‘§;§gsﬂ-§i a?iga i%ggg ,sgiigg 1 i! Pl
%;53; Hi iég Eii gggi iRl §§§g§§§ it uggg a;:,§ oy ;ngégj | ?g% ﬁgiﬁ zg§ .
sgissii agig li !! 55:-5 %; i g;;iii §§i§a;f iis - Estaf ggz;:;“% '%a i E z-;~ §§§§ %gi ' S -
HIRETTE I VYERIAE ST R U E SN G 1 s T MG GO e e <
oL it e st i B
il iy | i ; jit 1l ..i%;i i ;aggéiégg-ig il el §=§§ it i? §Ei i i;é
s=esitiny £ §5F .. ;nal I’il'ilﬁs__.i!— Eg sy Bl
%%%?%ggﬁ%&gﬁ%ﬁ%ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬂéﬁﬁﬁpﬁ$ﬂfgﬁ
etk 1 iteimer B WG sl il gl Lt ,gggisg
fercddfi agh H . o i il '55'5§'g§ §!§5i‘§§ gilg Beliit §§§;5"i §§ L R
T il B 3§ i ’"’ HIR M L FEEHE g i i
.ﬁéswﬂmiﬁf %M%%&ﬂwwﬁhﬁﬁﬁ
T T Qe S R T TR e
ATl B i o T o] R |
53 flai? Biaf7 *7aiie 8% 3 £ 8 % N T 34 n.i g H ;;,4.‘
: Zggﬁi‘;; §;§§;; i %ﬁgi il b ’géi‘ AN §i§ %sggp igii igm B i | afile
; il B it i g LR P 1l
g i ke B B IR AR L B
HH §=§§§§ﬂ %5::5; ggu% hgi ;92 ; i ; 5 %Lg ii‘i;'; §3 ﬁi ] Ei R R
i e e Ak D EHHN
M oahie bR e i, Ei s dac gBY
RIS T (e (IS SR Sl fa' S TR 10t 1] e e E
g T s
il b 551" i ig’?*éiai’ig’* el §~:§§i§sis R |
ek im}fﬁiﬁamiﬁ”m-%mrfm?h%@’ﬁhééﬂfﬁ i s
i ilﬁf?iig ' } at g gn E:E g linhiiig %5 ] E ; z- ii 10’ i"F' gsﬁ i ggi. 3 H§-< ‘3 ) i g
it “§§§§§ i il ssaasgiésé;iﬁ%:? i i %;wgafas lihl ;Egééi it ol gég e
il B i H;;z., b ;‘:3;"&' i i) Hek ¥ It Gl L g
Fid g-- i 3 o ;i L Es%ﬂ-g E!i g 'Eii g iig i :g L b | :.g ;iam T g
ﬁf%é’ﬂi%& iy il i ol G R B S

33;5 L §xiiiib§i§§§!$5 %3.58 LE §!3§'€ ngsiif L



l od on 1hw Cliy ol Tutsc’s webslte of 1hls tlnk:

LAY ) 1 o
Derwiy - Sl T e O VDS
dwelllng unihs. cloar-water wesie, humiditiers. dwlu:m Glen Proserties Lond Trust, ot o, mnn|nmn

| F IR Ei'i'ﬁii’i i s-*'a s mﬂiaggfz PRIt S0F TGE AR
i 55?’33 H 5; e ;ﬁ?‘? i i J:*-;:i i i fég‘““;’ﬁé gﬁ;~ tallii ;ﬁi@fé il §§i§%
a 1Raf gi s 1 M} 59" s 35 ;
E Eié;:?ii’g ii Eiggli g!i Egzgi;;gig a Eiégﬂ- 4 l!gig i; igi;sgg 52% i lé %igggg g;;i %;:;;é l Eég g;;gg g%?ga
sttt il !‘fi : o i b é' il
' ;g;;é%aggii ggiiiigs £t gigiéaiagsggsgi:.‘ §'§§§;§ﬁﬁ§ .g?i%:gsgig; Eg_ §§§ i‘:.§§ ié;i j:sg g;g 5?;
;o %igé*?éksﬁﬁﬁﬁmﬁééﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂgiiﬁh %vaa i *’sig?iﬁ
: !ii a:gt!ﬁ -itisﬁhi? ==§E=cg=ﬂ§§3 EEEEH’ELi:SnEms! !335 5!5 "3‘i ] !!s. ;gi. ?%E gl Rt
5 ! sgiigeqd gx;glii £ i53x gzg i 5‘? ‘: 5El “E§9§ gsg,r HEHTE ‘H?;!ﬂ gil' S | E g\- TR H
T gligigi h;% 533 i gggﬂ 5 §§ eg ’gggbiafglisi Eg !; tiE St jilh it
§E i 553 P E;i E 1355 5 g 3 ;; §§ éé i 1 L iaéza ii?a ?Eggggngs ii,; ;3;!
il ii"g?:g?iﬁa i ;.23553 3; 5“23@; aé'*‘ﬁig-igggaii Efﬁgﬂ g;ﬁgwé §g§§ §i§:§;i 535{ i
i anraﬁia aﬁ% 1 ;ghqiléﬁ?gnig o R
i ;ii’gg,g.gas.g i ;sig il it BRI )
b am%; ?3“';“;'3:1&5;% i e bt e o O o
i ik 1o i pHEf [ ga it !
i g Lﬂzv?mii:?gi 155h gigﬂil&.i%é 3 Eo Elngi Efﬂ“ §§ !ﬂiiézii!uﬂ Sgiagﬁxs R bl
A GO G B )
%iigéfigié Eiwis,é-a-.riff’:??“ st s i % il
it gigg ?g?gigﬁgz,?ﬁgi et ik 3*=§s-'§s? §;§3§§:§§;¥ i Efi gi il ig k!
iai!' ;gi ﬁ é EE; ;-!lg T 'iE —%g ligi 3; ;‘g ?- ng §§ ;i ;Ei g- g ’égiéggig
iR a:éggé;ggii it 'BH Al el o S L
%gﬁ&%%%ﬁfﬁ%%a%;fﬁﬁﬁﬁw@h§é;ﬁﬁ%
i3¢ ez B0 i : &1 3 si. ! L3 H H ;! L3> PrF
gi; %‘Hgig!e vééisasgii ’E’a‘:';agggé? igiﬂgéﬁggi;a%gg E’M st is o gni 44 §§§§E§§
gé"‘gg;gﬁﬁﬁgtﬁ?ﬂ'ggfgf"’f:ﬁgr'ﬂﬁgﬁgkgf“ﬁgigg3?*‘*ﬁ’ﬂig?§%?
il Ml iy ey L i G 1 3 "““; it
[HE iaéigfi 8 ; s ;? ;E i ég 1 TH ﬁ Hi-! 355 ggg g g gg sa%la iis
il ety 5?5?%%’ ;Zgnfig =l o giiiiii,ggg!’g’i i '§i %i .Zigsga;g ﬁ 2 filie 53.
g %ﬁﬁg%h%ﬂﬁgﬁz%z&isﬁﬁﬁé nLﬁF?hﬁ%
aii Bl B sl b i bty ! Bl iy e b
3 iﬁ; il ’Ec_é l‘;isgl g g 333 iglg : =§§ irslé g“ 53& ;;g&ggg
i i il ’§§§§§:§§§ i el bl o A



CLASSIFIED ~ Thursday, September 8,

toas ! tinished

tace wilhin 10 feet (334 mn) harizonsa) disionce,

Genersl. Engl Mmllnmsmlmmw-ﬂn

lnh section ond the submiticl, esoroval. (ntsection
ond testing resulrements of Section J14.

16834 Oll Sesarcters
where

mobls wos!
buliging dreinepe system or other meint of dlssees),
Exceptions
{1} An i) seporgior Is not resulred in hydrmstic
plts where an
ciorm & 1
sumss utilizsd s maintcin emergancy oseration ef e
eleveter by {ire (ighters.
(2) Olt seporoters shotl not be reeutred In 0 non-vdreutic
elevower st B

1101.7 Reof dasisn - Amendatery. Reohs thall be desipned lar
enaximum

:hr Gien Preperties Lond Trust, ¢t «l. Osfendanty. e
FIRST; The casts of scid action

The sromerty

hhhnl-ﬂlnnmuumml
to Order of this Court entered Augus! 4,

WITNESS MY HAND this ﬁv' AUG 18 2.

By: AV ), Rederick
Desuty

KIVELL, RAYMENT AND FRANCIS
A Protessianal Carsoration

Brien Rgyment, OBA 5741
‘ried Canter |, Suite S0

7644 Eonl 4151 Street

T Oklahemo 74133

Ti

wlestene (N18) 254-0624
Fecyimie (#13) 2545
E-mall;

dory crelness meom

m-u:r-nrnwsml-nllm.

11019 Seckwuter velves Stwm croiness syiterns sholl be
provided with bockwoter veives @ resuired for sonltery
drainope sytiems in ocoardonce with Sactien 14,

][_A 11,1 SIIE OF sEcounAlgv u:uEz!!j FOR A

HORIZONTALLY PROJECTED ROOF Al

(SQUARK FEET)
:(“HAD LENGTH OF WIBR IN INCHES
INCHES ¢ [t n n
1 nt M! m m i
T oM M 1% I!1| s
3 M3 -4 III 1% 142 B N
413 U U 1Y On SN

Feor Si: | inch - B4

£
4
E
£,
[}
g
i
H

i

|
]
g
i
i
i
§z

sholl be srevided on soch overtiow sise In occorg-
ance wilh Sacilen 708.

IPCO 118 Chapter 15 Reteraoced Stendards - Amendatery.
Mlsumlxnllhmmmmmummb
IIC. 13 Internctionat Bullding Coce® &3 ocosted
led by the mummmmnmouncc.
tECCO-08 tnternctienal Energy Camservation Cede®

(FC® 18 International Flre Code® o odewted
by the Stote of Okichoma Threugh the OUBCC.

IMC® 13 internatiens) Mechanico! Cose® mm arinmter an

and modk

ond modi{ied

ATTORNEYS FOR PLAINTIFF

Publlsned (n The
torbar §, X122

nas
Tulso Werid, Tuise Ceunty, Okiehama, Ses-

IN THE DISTRICT COURY IN AND FOR TULSA COUNTY
STATE OF OKLAHOMA

IINANCH OF

WILMINGTON $AVINGS FUND
$OCINTY, F

NOT INDIVIDUALLY

BUT SOLELY AS TIUSYE! FOR

$TI RED !
ICOUI!IYION Tlul" ?llbl!lll

Pisimit,

L3

DOROYHY T|
PERIONAL RE|

JAMES TRO

ELLs THE
:ES!NTAYIVE‘.

0,
THE UNKHWN SUCCESSORS; 0 al,

o

ELL, DECEASED, AND
Defendents.
svtre Camirc, Danea .
SALE O ND UNDER EXI 10
QO COLLE: BT AND Al

13 13 AN

is herety given that en the doy of OCT 11,18 X072,
IG'(&I.AJ‘..TIIW.MSI.CM-.:RIHL“&.
Otichorna, the undersisned Sherll will effer for sole and seil
for canh t9 e highest ond best bldder, sublect i real esicts

Fowor (4
i 16 150 Chty o

foxes, superior speciol assessments end cil tnter-

Lot Fowr (1), Block Fowr (4), ROLLING MEADOWS II, &
Subdlvisien s the Town of Glsapesl. Tuhe Couaty, S!

Bleck Fewr (1), ROLLING MBADOWS II,
Glenpesi, County, State of
knows @ M W 147 Pleca,

Glansesl, OK 7453) (1he " Preperty”)
‘Saje will e mede puriuan! e a Saecka) Exacutian and Or-

der of

t
Trexall; James Trexstl, o) af.. Detendants, n tlsty:
PIRST: Tha costs of seld ot

lICDKDx The
mininn

Iﬂ'n-'ll and lln! Ih\ ﬂ th Pﬂnﬂﬂ. Ml-

03000
WITNESS MY HAND Inis dov of AUG 28 X2

#v: & jomey Eftey
Deputy
KIVELL, RAYMENT AND FRANCIS
A Pretessionsd Cornerution

K. Renee’ Davhy, OBA 1516)
Trind %

hephace:
Fecsimile {¥10) 23413
£-mall: resvisgxivsil.com

ATTORNEYS FOR PLAINTIFF

X o
Published In the Tutso Werld, Tulso County, Okichema, Ses-
tember & 13 & 22, X7
IN THE Dl!rllﬂ COURT IN AND FOR TULSA COUNTY
STATH OF OKLAHOMA
JFS PRAIRIE vunulu FUND I, LLC,
An Otleherna Umited Liadilily company,

Pleixtltt,

McCrey Trmd
o LARRY R. LAKEY, an.
Ostandents.

Cane No. CV-IMU7
HOTICK 8 PUBLICATION

T'NE STATE OF OKLAHOMA TO DEFENDANTS LESLIE N.
WING AND THE UNKNOWN HEIRSOF THE ESTATE OF
I.AIIV R. LAKELY: '

VOU. AND EACH OF YOU, ARE NEIEBY ROTIFIED

he obove nomed Plelntiff hos filed ity Peiltien W Qulet

nnn tn 1he Dhatric Ceur! of Tutso w.smdm

ma, epelns) you, e each of you, sileging 1hal sach of sald

Owfendants may clelm some rlaw. title, or Interwai In the tek-
lowing-cuscrived resl proserties, towil:

Lat Sixtven (14) Leas S10 1o Cllv Bkock Flve (S), WIL-
REV YEIRACE. an Additien le 1he City of Tutsa, Tutso
Caunty, §! Oklaheme, lrl % the It Record-
o Plot i n--nn
. Lo Stx (4}, Block One ( Imhmﬁr-vlo-

diien, an Agaltion e ". Cl'v of Broken Arrew. Tulsa
. Shfe of Okisherna, occording e the lst Record-

i
g
]
1 4
1}
?
i
3
i

T
H
i
I
if
§
H

Lk
R
il
i
égi,ig
+ i
iiii;g

i
3t

no right, Lt oln, end
the Palntlt apeing) o) edverse claims of wid n-hnt.m

m’cmmmvv—unmmhmmum.

-

Oen Newberry, Court Clerk
Tulsa County, mm

Oy A/ Dimire Fermer
Owsuty "
(soul) ‘
i)
BARBER A BARTL
525 Seuth Main 8
Tuha, Okichems 14124511
Fhone (118} 91755,

e

Bidy will be occested by e Clty Clark
valld Ilhﬂbn (-'mkm- trom the Cliv of Tvie In
chasificatlons: NO 'IHOUALI-

e or
FIC.ATIONI IEOUIIID

trac) documents fer con-
tmprevernents of the sckd prelect
harve besn adestes by (he Mayer of 30k Clly. Cevles of seme
may be cbialned ot the Office of the Direcer of Englnesrimg

the Clty of Tuba En-l.r—ir- Services, 1017 South
00, Narth Bullding, ler & son-retundoble tee
In the emount of 11388 made sayabie 1 the Clly of Tulso by

Controct reaul mln:tuu complionce & rewuired
wmmmnm-mhummmmm"»

Enhr'rluwﬂllmhn
S

muuw-lmmvuumtm
Skckiors, ey W Traciers Ond Mai ket 1 W
mmnmmaum-mummsm

Q. T |lnul:nxn-llr-nm-mmmu
oxes, and 4 0.S. Section

¢
N
i

TR
? %? sl
L unEE
sgiaﬁfﬁg
it § gng :

i il it
sl i

bonds ec
Tutsq, tn conformity wilh the remulre-
mum o e w-a:d contract documents.

a Maintenencs bonds lﬂllhlﬂ‘.ﬂm
ﬂf'd m' (lm) of 1he contrac arice.
All bty wiil be coened cormidernd by The Bld leﬂl"l!
of sald City «t @ mest! sgid Correniites ts be held (n the
frI.N IIIIInﬂCl"MdIIIIlﬂHC"Yl”munm
Oated &1 Tutsa, Okichoma, this Ind duy ¢f September U72,
(sEAL) P
Cheisting Champelt
Clty Clerk. .

nan B
Pubilshed In the Tutse Werld, Tuiso Caunly, Oklaheme, Ses-
tember 1 & &, 1017 N

DOCUMENT 1113
. NOTIC® TO BIDDERS

M / for the con-
struction of the MIAMI PUBLIC SCHOOLS - PHYSICAL ED-
UCATION FAC|LITY ADDITION 'IIIID !w [

sslected
Wy MIAMI PUBLIC SCHOOLS (lr-
OIEWEI CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

EAS (the Cenytruct! b -I
BWA ucmrem PLLC (the Architect) A bits will be
received «f T MIAM! PUBLIC SCHOOLS, 1116 ROCKDALE
BLVD, MIAMI, OKLAHOMA 7¢I34 o0 SEPTEMBER 2, 111,
« 3:08 poa, ot which lime al) biss will b epened and maslicty

The Cenfroct Decuments will .nna- examipstien

h-lnm-ml.mnnnnmmumuln—
Carstnxtion Company In Okichems ang

P“?l:la—‘.mv-un'-

treest Construction News. )

Bidy recsived mnnmmnlmvv sx {%¢) hours, excluding Set-
vrdays, Sundays, end before 1ime 141 fer.epening

ua.u-nuumnnmmmummwnmmm&

will nol be considared ond will be refurned unopenad. . .

A comhier's check, certified check, tn ameont
dlmm(sildlmmﬂnwdmml

pony the sraposal of sach bidder. Dnullu
'ﬂlhlm.

The bidding documents, Inckudlng (he drowings and saeclfica-
:mmnmmmc«-ﬂwxum
Prejeci Coningtien Maneser, 2] Ssth Cheutsou Ave,
Cherieou, 14117, Phene (N10) ﬂmll_lrﬁlﬂ
of o deecall of Two Hungred Fifty Dallors (3 190.00) ser set,

——— e o=

- 2~

R

P N

i

PR A

P U Y
P S

|
}




s s o T T ¥ | Vet B0 ITIET a1 S AT
. tien In These bld @ecernents.
IRC® 13 tarernatiencl Resldential Code® O3 adested fum dute of m_:-dmd“uﬁa.mnm

tiar the schuol
Mtuwxmsmummmmwuc -y 0 o lon Mancgers Bid Book fer the ilst-
uunnmuum .
anuande rico] Cade® o odesied ond madl kel N R ar
flot T o O oo DUBEC, The Canytructl oo, Archifect wi0 ‘conguct w >
SEPTEMBER 14, 7171 @ 10 AM & e

ANSI ATILIO-P Seeciikotins for

Load Beoring, Bordied,
ior Thin Sei Cerornic Tile end Ok
marsien Sione tnatotlction. @1.5.1.5, A1.5.2.4
TCHA/ANS) ALLIOW. Smllhﬂl'ﬂ for Lesd Bearine,

Memarones for Thin Sef Caremic Tie
ond Shone In Sectiens
Qr5.23 and ©1.5.2.6 hos been stricken from [he code.”

Section 3. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES.
Thet off ertiinances ar sarts of erdiasnces in conflict herv-

The Owner ressrves the right te woive any infermedlly, o
nl-:l-wurtllum

SELECT 81D PACKAGES BIDDING ON
SEPTEMSER . X7

PROJECT NO. I9U-1531204 VENSEL SOUTH DRAINAGE

i e ang £he e e nw exmeeSsly rEmeeted cacaed. (MPROVEMENTS PHASE il { ACCESS ROAD) BY STESORY L STORM DRAINAGE
. Q CONCRETE
s-:rlm:.sEVEuulLlanv;muss //aw-:un,-n- The sreperty hos been duly cesrsised th the sum ef m-::-nudmwmu-nmn- MASONRY
Clouse e anrese of 1Ais ercinaxce er any mart tersad | $10.400.00. oy .
Iy for amy ccmen (e e be invalil br.mdm-‘: ¥ TRFRE.Srm Sewer. Fioos HRUSN 501 ARCHITECTURAL MILLWORK
fortscict D decision shat] rot atfect ihe vaikily of TN . LANT]
remcincier e this ardinance er any sart thered. i WITNESS MY HAKD mis day o AUG 1.2 AMANDATORY Pretie ‘Canference {5 schwduted for Tuer- CAULKING & SEALANTS
axy Sswtember 1. m o 19 m - will be heid m ALUMINUM STOREFRONT
Soctian «. EMERGENCY CLAUSE. That en amergercy Micrasst) HAR
new dectarss s the mreservation ef Ihe molic oy p e Eated i DRYWALL & CEILINGS
., Aecift el ‘b’rl Br rm-' where! ihis erdinance FLOOR COVERINGS
i fake effect iy from and after ifs sossepe, o

PAINTING
KIVELL RAYMENT AND FRANCIS :SPECIALTIES .
A Profssienct Corserciien, s

%}PTEDM"HTMMGN&MLN‘MMM‘M

S8RESAIILRL

SIGNAGE & INSTALLATION
Jeson Howsell, OBA £INNDY LOCKERS
Triod Centar 1, Sulte S CANOPIES
ADOPTED &3 an emergoncy rmecsure. this 241h Dey of Au- | 764 Ecst élst Street 1 EQUIPMENT
" o Tutsa, D L] RO\.LEI SN.ADE! .
Telephone {91! 3 METAL DING
Lori Daecter Wright, Chair of the Clly Fecsimile (113) 154MS A PLUMBIN UTILITIES
Cauncl) E-mail: |howe!i®Xveil.com of g FIRE SUPPRESSION
APPIOVED the of the CI A aapted by ﬂI Mlv' oM CI
by mMg’l,\,l‘ M-C‘?‘: TTORNEYS FOR PLAINTIFF ey be a1 1he Office of The Direcior of Engineering . ﬁ ELECTRICAL }
..,m Sarvices ot the Cliy of Tutso Enginesring Services, D17 South
Jhxnk.n\. lmdln. Nerih Bullding, “’.m e
G T. Bynum, Movor ameunt of 1500 mode SaYODM MIAMI PUBLIC SCHOOLS '
ATTEST; Christino  Chemwetl, Clty "] Pusitaned tn the Tuse m""r'.’.m Coun Seo- S e ikl OKLANGMA
: 3 g .
‘ Controct what] include cammilonce s rewuired
Clack fember &8 15 223 by kow %o he sractice of In em-
A'.P'PIOVED'. Juck Blalr, Clty Anor- | N THE DISTRICT COURT IN AND FOR TULSA COUNTY | Shevmment. . .

j STATE OF OKLAHOMA
0 = | COMMUNITY LOAN SERVICING,
e,

i Smal nau
|
wou! for this sredect I3 ten (10) sercent. Publishes :n‘r:: T.,aga Werld, Tuha Ceunty, Okichema. Ses-

nen
Putilshed In the Tuba Werkl, Tutso Cauaty, Okicroma, Ses- A e e R . o i Do | e DISTRICT COURT IN AND FOR TULSA COUNTY
Tember 148,202 Pleatitt, sroloct o e 1y percont bera ice mn-nn . S STATE OF OKLAHOMA -
INTHE DISTRICT COY COURT N AND FOR TULSA COUNTY | va. T e SA Insoch oo cRzSITEIE. COMMUNITY LOAN SERVICING, -
N Attention (s cotled s Rexhition 704 of Nevermoer & 20k 1+ | SERVICING, LLC, A DEaARe
WILLIAM R WINES, Inglvioually) . RSONAL B nss:nnrlvu. Suiring Mdders, their suboantrociors end ihelr kower-fier LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY)
WILLIAM R, WINES ond KAREN R ',’ﬂv'“g“ TRUSTEES, Conirotfors % i onty i ena & e Ui Erres. ”
WIN rustees of the GARY CCESSORS AND ASSIONS OF Praintit,
NG WINES TRUST, MICHAEL J. HARPER, DRCEASED, ey T e e i B0 St N
WINI.EISA.MC:YWINES“GAIV BING :,N-D.YNI UNKNOWN SUCCESSORS) 1256(10), dlract o e the Clty ore aise ! trem .
KAYE WINES GONZALES TIUST those daxes. A

LYNN YEANDLE; st ol
and GARY BING WINES, Individumily,

Ottentants.
Plcintlft,
Cove Ne. CJ 1173 10
. Jwive Mawacaan, William
STRUCTURAL SOLUTIONS USA, NOTICH OF $ALE OF LAND UNOER EXECUTION
INC, an Okiohamg Carporotion; ond .
DEER GLEN PROPERTIES LAND 13 13 AN ATTE, COLLECT A DEBT AND AN
TRUST,
. .
Cose No. CJ-2020-1513 i H e
Judge Conirell, Daxnan and salt for cesh e the highes! and best bidder, sublect 10 ry- | CY30Me 10 th Clly of Tuha, In cantormily wirh the require-
OTICE OF Fou: LIAS SALE flyrresb e paiily o agloiogesi ey e ey e Terrce Sk i b P oo
a 13 of record, 1f ony, excest the and inter- 3
E@;Wé‘%@mw 413 foracieuad harein an the fuliowing described roed Proper- @rod pereant (100%) of the contract price.
1. towit:
IS S AN EMPY TO COLLE! DEBT AND AN’ All bids will by cpened and comaidered by the Bid Cemmittee
s o (18), Block Twealy {18), MAPLEWOOD ADDI. | % W% Cliv 61 o meeting of sclat Comumitiue 1 be hatd In the
TION o rhe Clly 'of Tutte, Culiiornn, Coumty ot Totsa, | Cllv Counctl Reem of City 1l kn said Cify @1 9:00 o.m. &
o 0ctou T o | e T e § L T2 AL DX | pwmgr e e
[ an the eay of OCT 64, X72 - L
10 ocleck, AM. 713 W éth 51, Confersnce Reem, Tuiss, [ 74113 (1De “Preserty*) Duled a1 Tutaa, Okichama. this 2nd da of Septamber X177,
Okicrwna, Sherfil will offer for fourth elles (SEAL)
tolg ond sel) ter cash 1o the highest and best bader, cublec Alhnh-ﬂlhn‘nnumlncs-uusnmu 1
= road ecte ad voiore M, Guerier spectel csesimants | @na Order of Alls Sale traed et 81 the sfice of the Caurt Chriyiing Ghopeell
ang all Intereats of record, {f any, excast Ihe Mortgose end | Clerk In and for Tetse Ceunty, Oklohomo. and sursuon! iy
interests forsciemed berein an the follewing deacribed recl | mid [udpment resarving the rist of Pleintlil % reccll see
' S0l exscutien by &l snmeuncermens endAw erder of the Ceurt, |*
wrior atis gie, meld fustement enferse n the Dlstrict
The West Helf of the Narfrwest Guerter and (e Sewth- | Court

Quorter end the West Nedf CJ 3121 MR, entitied Canmunity Leen Servicine, LLC 2000002

of the Narthoat of the Nerftrwest Querter and | Plaindifi, va. Michos] 3. Harser) Pensioss Harser, st a1, Os

The Sextheat! Quarter of e Herttwesl Quarter of Me | fencanty, o setisfy: . NOTICH TO BIODERS

Norttwes) Quarter and Querter of the FIRSTI The casts of said ection ectrued ent eccrulng) SEALED 810 FOR

N -ene, Towrship Twen- 3! D' The |udement end first llan of the Piintin, PROJECT NO. SP 1101

trang Ni Redpe Thirtemm Exsl, (W2 NWA and SEN Loan Servicing, LLC, In the sum of

NWM and W/ NEA NWA and SEN NEM NWA and SWA | with interest thersen &t the rete of 9.4% ser encim, @ od- mﬂnhnnwu tha) morwont te en erder by e May-
NEA § 21-TTIN-R1JE), Tulse Comty, Sixte of Okighemma, | [usted, It amslicoble, trem Auguel 1. 2019, untll scki; edvan- | & ef e City of Tubwo, Okishome, sesied bidy will be re-
o] sertace and minersl tntarests. cex far K, awronce end sretervetion expenses, sccrued | ceived kn Roem 260 of the Otfice of the City Clerk, City of Tul-

eng occruing; etetrecting expermses. occrued and eccruings | sa, 173 €. I Strest. mammnwnmg

Fourth allos sae will be made sursuont ko ¢ Specka! Exe- fwes and casty, | arty) and en Gtiormay’s fee, sk
cutlen ond Order of Feurih Alics Sole hsued sut et the efiice | casta with injerust thersan «f the same rete, untll seld. ol loher lh.-nmvhu
ot e Court Clerk In and tor Tube Ceunty, Okishoma, end -Inn-c-w:ﬂmumm.
sursuon? b aid judemen) reserving the risht of Plaintllf te Pm-m-nm-mm.lnnrmmmm
recnt) sold exacution by orel announcement endiw erder of | Inchuding Thsie whese Scusl afdre1des are Unknewn and per- | PROJECT NO. SP 1141 Tuise Purfarming Arty Conter Stage
the Court, arics ie the feurth cllas sale. aald futoment en- | sens er eiher entities who have or MEY have tOKnOwn wWCCm. | Flowr Replecsent
fered In the District Caurt bt ond for seld Ceunty, Staw of | sers eng such unknswn successary ore heredy nelified ore,
Oklhema. In Cose Ns. CJ-220-1513, entitied Williom R. | The Heirs. Persenci Resresanicl Devisess. Trustess, | The eniire st of ihe (merevernent | b poM frem Ac-
Wines, inéividucily; Willlam R, Wines and Karen R. Wines, | Successers and Asiisns of MiChos! J. Horser, Decsowd, end | count Na. | mmmmumuuu
Co-Truttwes of the Gary Bl Wines Trwat, Williom R. Wines | Ine Unknown Successors; Peneies Harper) Ocrusents of the
ond Gary Bling Wines, Co-Trustees of the Bonnle Koye Wines A MANDATORY Pra-Rig Conterence I3 scheduted for Tues-
Genzses Trust, ond Gary Bing Wines, indivisucily, Plalntit, oay, Sextomber 12 1021 @ 9:00 &m: ard will bn bk

Threugh
video conferwncing with Micrasel! Tearms, Invilatien sresent-

et i ]

;
;
i
i
4




