
Item #: 33

Moved by: BRADFORD Prepared by: Bobb Decker

Shelby Co. Building Official

Seconded by: FORD Reviewed by: Robert B. Rolwin

Assistant County Attorney

JOINT ORDINANCE NO. 524 

JOINT ORDINANCE AMENDING THE MEMPHIS AND SHELBY COUNTY

BUILDING CODE 80 AS TO ADOPT THE 2021 EDITION OF THE ICC

INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE AND LOCAL

AMENDMENTS. SPONSORED BY CHAIRMAN WILLIE BROOKS,

COMMISSIONER DAVID BRADFORD AND COMMISSIONER BRANDON

MORRlSON.

WHEREAS, The Shelby County Board of Commissioners and the Council of the 

City of Memphis seek to adopt and maintain a comprehensive set of coordinated

Technical Codes and to update those Codes to assure the. safe and effective construction

of commercial and residential buildings and structures in the community; and

WHEREAS, The need for sustainable and energy efficient buildings, structures,

and building systems, has never been more important to this community and the

promotion of construction that recognizes the need for such energy efficiency and 

construction sustainability is crucial to the smart growth of this community and for the

WHEREAS, It is necessary and prudent to adopt a more recent edition of the

standard code specifically covering the energy use and required insulation for the

construction of structures and their support systems in both commercial and residential

structures that had previously been covered by regulations of the 2015 Edition of the

of its citizens; and



International Code Council (ICC) Energy Conservation Code which is now outdated; and 

WHEREAS, Copies of the 2021 Edition of the ICC International Energy

Conservation Code have been placed in the Shelby County Commission and Memphis 

City Council Minutes Offices for public review before their adoption by reference, as

WHEREAS, The provisions of the 2021 Edition of the ICC International Energy

Conservation Code, when adopted by the Board and Council, will provide a modem and

internally consistent Code for evaluating proposed construction and is within the family of

codes already adepted in Memphis and Shelby County.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

OF SHELBY COUNTY, TENNESSEE, That all previous energy conservation codes are

hereby repealed except as may be set out in the attachments hereto, and that the 2021

Edition of the ICC International Energy Conservation Code is hereby adopted by reference,

a copy of said code being on file in the Minutes Offices of the Shelby County Board of

Commissioners and of the Memphis City Council.

BE iT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the 2021 Edition of the ICC International

Energy Conservation Code is amended by adoption of the local amendments attached to

this Joint Ordinance as Exhibit A. 

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the 2021 Edition of the ICC International

Energy Conservation Code and those local amendments attached to this Joint Ordinance

as Exhibit A are hereby incorporated by reference as if set out herein in their entirety, and

that no Appendices from the 2021 Edition of the ICC International Energy Conservation

Code are adopted.

required by state law; and



BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That should any part of this ordinance or code be 

found to be unlawful or unenforceable by a court of competent jurisdiction that such a 

determination will have no effect on the other portions of the adopted Code and 

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the adoption of the 2021 Edition of the ICC 

International Energy Conservation Code and local amendments shall be known as the

2021 Memphis and Shelby County Energy Conservation Code, and shall be implemented

through their inclusion in the appropriate section of the Memphis and Shelby County

Building Code, the Memphis and Shelby County Residential Code, and other Technical

Codes which contain provisions that address the appropriate standards for energy

efficiency of various buildings, structures, and internal support systems.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That Chapter 6, Article II, of the Shelby County

Code of Ordinances, 6-48 as currently encoded, is amended to make such changes as 

necessary to reflect adoption of the 2021 Memphis and Shelby County Energy

Conservation Code, in accordance with the changes shown in Exhibit B attached hereto

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Joint Ordinance shall take effect in the

City of Memphis and the unincorporated areas of Shelby County on December 31, 2021,

by virtue of the concurring and separate passage thereof by the Board of Commissioners

of Shelby County and the Memphis City Council, or if not adopted by each legislative 

body by that date, at the date of such adoption by the last adopting body.

and incorporated herein by reference.

amendments thereto.



FIRST READING: Se tember 27 2021

ee Harris

Shelby County Mayor

0909 1

ADOPTED

THIRD READING: November 1 2021

SECOND READING: October 18 2021

ERTIFIED OPY

RK OF CO TY COMMISSION

DATE

U

Clerk of County ommission

Date:



Summary Sheet

l. Descri tion of Item

A Joint Ordinance amending the Memphis and Shelby County Energy Conservation

Code to adopt the 2021 Edition of the ICC International Energy Conservation Code, and

to replace the 2015 Edition of the ICC International Building Code currently enforced. A

limited number of local amendments to that standard code are included to make the

Code more appropriate for this jurisdiction. The Building Code Advisory Board of

volunteer professionals met over a period of several months and worked out these local

amendments.

State law requires that local governments update their technical construction codes

every few years. Therefore a series of ordinances are submitted to revise these codes.

The codes were last updated in 2018.

The effective date of these ordinances is December 31, 2021

C. Additional or Subsequent Obligations or Expenses of Shelby County

II. Source and Amount of Fundin

A. Amount Expended/Budget Line Item

IV. Additional Information Relevant to A roval of this Item 

Administration recommends approval of this Amendment.

Ill. Contract Items NIA 

A. Type of Contract N/A

B. Terms N/A

B. All Costs (Direct/Indirect)

NONE.

NONE.

NONE.



EXHIBIT A

1. Amend Section C101.1 Entitled So When Amended It Shall Read As

Follows:

C101.1 Title. This code shall be known as the 2021 Memphis and Shelby County

Energy Conservation Code and shall be cited as such. It is referred to herein as

2. Delete C104 Entitled And All Subsections Under It And Reserve the

Section Number So That When Amended It Shall Read:

Section C 104 Reserved.

3. Amend Section C105.2.6 B Removin Re uirements On Commissionin Of A

Buildin In The Final Ins ection So When Amended The Section Shall Read As

Follows:

C105.2.6 Final inspection. The building shall have a inspection and shall

not be occupied until approved. The inspection shall include of

the installation and proper operation of all required building controls.

4. Amend Section C110.1 S0 That When Amended It Shall Read As

Follows:

C110.1 General. The Memphis and Shelby County Joint Board of Appeals shall

be the appeals body which is authorized to hear and decide appeals of orders,

decisions or determinations made by the code relative to the application

and interpretation of this code. It shall have the same authority and

responsibilities to hear such appeals and make such detemlinations as is

authorized in the Memphis and Shelby County Building Code.

5. Delete Section C110.2 Entitled On Authori Without Re lacement.

6. Delete Section C110.3 Entitled Without Re lacement.

7. Amend Section C301.1 Entitled So When Amended It Shall Read As

Follows:

C301.1 General. - Climate zones in Figure C301.1 or Table C301 .1 shall be used

in determining the applicable requirements from Chapters 4 and 5.



8. Amend Section C403.5 Entitled B Addin A New Exce tion #8

Which Shall Read As Follows:

8. Buildings, which due to their size or intended use, and based on an analysis

provided by the engineer and satisfactory to the Building will not realize

an economic payback 0n the use of this equipment within a 10 year equipment life

assumption.

9. Amend Section C405.2.4 Entitled li ht Res onsive B Addin A

New Exce tion # 4 Which Shall Read As Follows:

4. Any area or room which as a single daylight control zone which does

not have fenestration, either by window or skylight, that exceeds 250 square feet.

10. Delete Section C405.6 Entitled Electrical Without

Re lacement.

11. Delete Section Entitled Rece tacle and Section

C405.11.1 Entitled Rece tacle Control Without

Re lacement.

12. Delete Section Entitled Monitorin And All Its Subsections

Without Re lacement.

13. Delete Section C408 Entitled Information and S stem

Commissionin And All Its Subsections Without Re lacement

14. Amend Section C502.2 Entitled Chan e In S ace Conditionin B Deletin The

Existin Provisions Re lacin It As Shown Below:

C502.2 Change in space conditioning.- Any nonconditioned space that

represents 5% of a commercial building, in which it is located, which is altered to 

become conditioned space shall be required to be brought into full compliance

with this code. The Building may look back for two years prior to the

application to capture other projects during that time that increased the area 

of conditioned space and total those previously conditioned areas with the

proposed area to determine if the applicable area threshold is exceeded.

15. Amend Section C5032 to add the followin Exce tion 2:

Exception 2: Compliance with the requirements of Section C402 (Building

Envelope Requirements) is not required unless the change in occupancy or use

will increase fuel or energy use by more than twenty percent (25%) and the 

renovations include changes to at least twenty percent (25%) of the building



envelope. In such cases, all envelope renovations much incorporate Section C402

requirements to the extent it is not structurally impractical to do so.

16. Amend Section C503.3 to add the followin Exce tion 1:

Exception 1: If change of occupancy or use which will increase or energy

use requires renovations that are more than twenty percent (25%) of the area

of the space then that renovate portion of the building must meet all requirements
in Section C403 (Building Mechanical Systems) except compliance with Section

C403 is waived where HVAC systems do not serve at least twice the area

renovated.

17. Amend Section C503.4 to add the followin Exce tion 1:

Exception 1: If change of occupancy or use which will increase fuel or energy 

use requires renovations that are more than twenty percent (25%) of the area 

of the space then that renovated portion of the building must meet all

requirements in Section C404 (Service Water Heating) except compliance with

Section C404 is waived where heating water systems do not serve at least twice

the area renovated.

18. Amend Section C5035 to add the followin Exce tion 2:

Exception 2: If change of occupancy or use which will increase fuel or energy

use requires renovations that are more than twenty percent (25%) of the area

of the space then that renovate portion of the building must meet all requirements

in Section C405 (Electrical Power and Lighting System).

19. Amend Section R101.1 Entitled So When Amended It Shall Read As

Follows:

R101.1 Title. This code shall be known as the 2021 Memphis and Shelby County

Energy Conservation Code and shall be cited as such. It is referred to herein as

20. Delete Section R104 Entitled And All Subsections Under It And Reserve

the Section Number So That When Amended It Shall Read:

Section R104 Reserved.



25. Delete Section R401.3 Entitled Without Re lacement

26. Re lace Table R402.1.3 Entitled Minimum R-Values And

Fenestration Re uirements B Com With The Table Provided Below:

21. Amend Section R109.4 Entitled To Com 1 So When Amended It

Shall Read As Follows:

R109.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having 

been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to 

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a of not

less than one dollar or more than dollars.

22. Amend Section R110.1 Entitled So That When Amended It Shall

Read As F ollows:

R109.1 General. The Memphis and Shelby County Joint Board of Appeals shall

be the appeals body which is authorized to hear and decide appeals of orders, 

decisions or determinations made by the code relative to the application

and interpretation of this code. It shall have the same authority and responsibilities

to hear such appeals and make such determinations as is authorized in the

Memphis and Shelby County Building Code.

23. Delete Section R110.2 Entitled On Authori Without

Re lacement.

24. Delete Section R1103 Entitled Without Re lacement.



.36
on.

523

:58in
05

wEEEm

of

N.
_

dog

nozoom
8

250

EEoEmoM

9:
mo

N._.N.
5mm

aouoom
:33

aocwbmonom
$28

SEE:
8m
.m

dc?
mmmE

mo

05
:0

mm

2.:

3a:
:2:

0.88

momma?
0387M
960%
Bi
.m

Agom
oEmH

9515mm
ousmE
>9

88mg
mm

25:82

283-883
E

@9553
on

:2?

EoEommm
I
o

.35?

3:8:
Sm

m

28M
E

mm

Eggs?
doom
N

.6

wzuoom
05
mo

05

:me

Enemy

v83:
Sm

mo:_m>-m
92m

05
9

325
on

:2?
mi
.c

3QO
1580
2:
mo

H0135
05

sowing:
2-x
E

050:
2:
mo

5th0
.8

SEBE
2:
no

@233:

msosqcaoo
gm

manor:
:2
\w:
-o

:m
2

@23an
5:38
UGEw
BE.

.wEmFEm

GEES

couwbmoaom
BEL

-

.DEETN

Ea
B

E

03m>--
=3

commoEEoQ
2:

@832:
on

=Em

308

.8

Tm
K3

68.68
E

2:

:25

wEEEm
8mm

Echo:
95

638558
333
3-x

Eu

00mm
95

.wEEEEE
Em

-

m

min

o

o

2%

3

wk

ma

om

omd

mod

omd

m

_

5&5

..

o

2.13-2

um.

u:_a>-~

.2

n

03.5%

315$
:55

.E

55:58:;
a

a

BSN

=55

83m
.395

52m

:35

EuEuwam

.SeE

:55
mg:

25.5
E55

uE=oU

35:0

EH35

825.0

a

QZ<

29251::



27. Amend Section R402.2.4 Entitled Hatches And B Deletin the

entire section and re lacin with the followin :

R402.2.4 Access hatches and doors. Access hatches from conditioned spaces to

unconditioned spaces such as attics and crawl spaces shall be weatherstripped.

28. Amend Section R402.2.4.1 Entitled Hatches And Door Insulation

Installation and B Deletin the entire section after the word

ui to read as follows:

R402.2.4 Access batches and door insulation installation and retention.

Vertical or hon'zontal and doors from conditioned spaces to unconditioned spaces

such as attics and crawl spaces shall be weatherstripped. Access that prevents

damaging or compressing the insulation shall be provided to all equipment.

29. Amend Section R402.3.3 Entitled Fenestration Exem B Insertin

S uare Feet 4.2 M2 In Place Of S uare Feet 1.4m2 So When It Is

Amended The Section Shall Read As Follows:

R402.3.3 Glazed fenestration exemption. Not Greater than 45 square feet (4.2 

M2) of glazed fenestration per dwelling unit shall be exempt from the U-factor 

and SHGC requirements in Section R402.1.2. This exemption shall not apply to 

the Total UA alternative in Section R402.1.5.

30. Delete Existin Table R402.4.1.1 Entitled Barrier Air Sealin And

Insulation And Re lace It With The Table Provided Below:

TABLE R402.4.1.l

AIR BARRIERS AND INSULATION INSTALLATION COMPONENT

COMPONENT CRITERIA

Exterior thermal envelope insulation for framed walls is installed in substantial 

contact or continuous alignment with the building envelope air bam'er 

Air Barrier and Thermal Insulation Breaks or joints in air barrier are and repaired. 

Air-permeable insulation is not used as a sealing material.

Air- ermeahle insulation is inside of an air barrier.

Air Barrier in dropped is substantially aligned with insulation an any

Ceiling/attic gaps are sealed.

Attic access exce tunvented attic 
, 
knee wall door, or dro down stair is sealed.

Walls Comers and headers are sealed.

Junction with foundation and sill late is sealed.

Windows and doors S ace between Windows/door 'ams and is sealed.

Rim Joists Rim 'oints are insulated and include air barn'er. 

Floors Insulation installed to maintain permanent contact with underside of

(including above garage and decking
cantilevered Air Barrier is installed at an ex osed ed 6 of insulation.

Insulation is ermanentl attached to walls.

m



PP E) P

35. Delete Section R403.3.6 Entitled Leaka Without Re lacement.

36. Amend Section R403.3.7 Entitled B Addin The Phrase At

The End Of The Existin Lan ua e t For Return Air On Interior So

When Amended It Reads As Follows:

Crawl space walls Exposed earth in unvented crawl space is covered with Class 1 vapor retarder with

overla in 'oints ta ed.

Shafts, penetrations Duct shafts, utility penetrations, knee walls and shafts opening to exterior or

unconditioned s ace are sealed.

Narrow cavities Batts in narrow cavities are cut to or narrow cavities are with sprayed or

blown insulation.

Gara e se aration Air sealin is rovided between the ara e and conditioned 3 aces.

Recessed lighting Recessed light are air tight, IC rated, and sealed to drywall.
Exce tion - F ixtures in conditioned s ace. 

Insulation is placed between outside and pipes. Batt insulation is cut to around

Plumbing and Wiring wiring and plumbing, or sprayed/blown insulation extends behind piping and

wirin
.

Shower/tub on exterior wall Showers and tubs on exterior wall have insulation and an air barrier separating 
them from the exterior wall. 

Electrical/ hone box on exterior walls Air barrier extends behind box or air sealed-t e boxes are installed.

Common Wall Air barrier is installed in common wall between dwellin units.

HVAC register boots HVAC register boots that penetrate building envelope are sealed to or

d all.

Fire lace Fire lace walls include an air barrier.

3]. Delete Section R402.4.1.2 402.4.1.3 Entitled In Its Entire With No

Re lacement.

32. Delete Section R402.4.1.3 Entitled e In Its Entire With No

Re laeement.

33. Amend Section R402.4.2 Entitled B Deletin The Phrase

Outdoor Combustion Without Re lacement So When Amended It Shall Read 

As Follows:

R402.4.2 Fireplaces. New wood-burning shall have

dampers or doors. Where using doors on factory-built listed

and labeled in accordance with UL 127, the doors shall be tested and listed for the

Where using doors on masonry the door shall be

listed and labeled in accordance with UL 907.

34. Delete Section R403.3.5 Entitled Testin Without Re lacement.



_P

(R ).

_L

ggp v

LEQP

R403.3.5 Building cavities. Building framing cavities shall not be used as ducts

0r plenums except for return air on interior walls.

37. Delete Section R403.5.1 Entitled Water Circulation And Tem erature

Maintenance S To remove the sentence so when amended it shall read

as follows:

R403.5.1 Heated water circulation and temperature maintenance systems.

Heat trace temperature maintenance systems shall be in accordance with Section 

R403.5.1.2. Automatic controls, temperature sensors and pumps shall be in a

location with access. Manual controls shall be in a location with ready access.

38. Delete Section R403.5.1.1. Entitled S without re lacement

39. Delete Section R403.5.1.1.1 Entitled Recirculatin Water S

without re lacement.

40. Amend Section R403.6 Entitled Bv Deletin The Last

Sentence In So That When Amended Its Shall Read As Follows:

R403.6 Mechanical ventilation. Buildings and dwelling units shall be provided

with ventilation that meets the requirements of the International Residential Code 

or International Mechanical Code, as applicable or with other approved means of 

ventilation.

41. Delete Sections R403.10 Entitled Consum tion of Pools And S And

All Of Its Subsections 403.10.1 R403.10.2 R403.10.3 R403.11 Entitled

S And R403.12 Entitled Pools And Permanent Residential S

Without Re lacement.

42. Amend Section R404.1 Entitled htin E ui b re lacin with

less than 75 in the two laces it a ears in this section so that when

amended it shall read as follows:

R404.1 Lighting equipment (Mandatory). Not less than 75 percent of permanently

installed lighting excluding kitchen appliance lighting shall contain

only lighting sources.

Exception: Low voltage lighting.

43. Delete Section R404.1.2 Entitled Gas Li htin E ui Without

Re lacement.

44. Delete Section R404.2 Entitled Li htin without

re lacement.

.1



45. Delete Section R405.3.2.1 Entitled liance Re ort For Permit A

And Section R405.3.2.2 Entitled liance Re art For Of

Occu anc In Their Entire Without Re lacement But Showin The Section

Numbers As To Preserve Numberin Consistenc Of The Remainin

Sections. So When Amended The Shall Read:

R405.4.3.1 - Reserved.

R405.4.3.2 - Reserved.

46. Delete Existin Section R502.2 Entitled e In S ace Conditionin And

Re lace It With The F ollowin :

R502.2 Change in space Any nonconditioned space which is

altered to become conditioned space shall be required to be brought into full

compliance with the envelope insulation requirements of Section R402.1.2 this

code.

1



-ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

EXHIBIT B

Amendments to the Shelby County Code

Amend sec. 6-48 as follows.

ARTICLE II. - MEMPHIS AND SHELBY COUNTY BUILDING CODE

Sec. 6-48. International Energy Conservation Code.

(a) Adopted. The 2021 Edition of the International Code Council (ICC) Energy Conservation

Code is hereby adopted.

(b) Local amendments. The 2021 Edition of the ICC International Energy Conservation Code is

amended by adoption of the local amendments attached to J oint Ordinance No. (on with

the county), as exhibit A. The local amendments are available on the website of the of

Construction Enforcement.

(c) Incorporated by reference. The 2021 Edition of the ICC International Energy Conservation

Code and those local amendments attached to Joint Ordinance No. as exhibit A are

hereby incorporated by reference as if set out herein in their entirety. No appendices from the

2021 Edition of the International Energy Conservation Code were adopted.

((1) Implementation. The adoption of the 2021 Edition of the International Energy 

Conservation Code and those local amendments attached thereto, shall be implemented through

their inclusion in the appropriate section of the Memphis and Shelby County Building Code,

Memphis and Shelby County Residential Code and other Technical Codes which contain

provisions that addresses the appropriate standards for the construction and installation of such

energy conservation designs, requirements and equipment.

(e) date. This section shall take effect in the City of Memphis and the unincorporated

areas of the county on December 31, 2021 by virtue of the concurring and separate passage thereof 

by the Memphis City Council and by the board of commissioners of the county, or if not adopted

by each legislative body by that date. at the date of such adoption by the second body.


