10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

ENACTED 5/8/12

Introduced by the Council President at the request of the Mayor:

ORDINANCE 2012-214-E
AN ORDINANCE CONCERNING WIND ZONES AND THE
FLORIDA BUILDING CODE; AMENDING SECTION
320.103 (WIND ZONES), PART 1 (ADMINISTRATION;
TITLE, PURPOSE AND SCOPE) , CHAPTER 320
(GENERAL PROVISIONS), AND SECTION 321.101
(ADOPTION OF APPENDICES), CHAPTER 320
(ADOPTION OF BUILDING CODE), ORDINANCE CODE TO
UPDATE WIND ZONES AND REFERENCES TO THE
FLORIDA BUILDING CODE APPENDICES CONSISTENT
WITH RECENT CHANGES TO THE FLORIDA BUILDING

CODE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Jacksonville:
Section 1. Section 320.103 (Wind zones) amended. Section
320.103 (Wind =zones), Part 1 (Administration; Title, Purpose and
Scope), Chapter 320 (General Provisions), Ordinance Code, 1is hereby
amended in part as follows:
CHAPTER 320. GENERAL PROVISIONS.

PART 1. ADMINISTRATION; TITLE, PURPOSE AND SCOPE

* % %
Sec. 320.103. Wind zones.
I PANETN nillirmrmoc o £ ot it a10- ] A o9 + 1 1 ot o n £ + 120N merh
[ S N t’uJ_LJUU A\ [ J WIS N U I NP Wiy U R Sy @ R By oL n)-L\jJ.J., CIT Ju € N W N A\ LS R - A\ J.I.I.rIJ.J.
4l 14 £ +h JaE s £ Toclamnnszs 11 P SN | N o £-711 o
LA W i N N A )y [ S N I J_k,_Y A\ L\ & BN AN R i i E N i Y [ % & i S Ly Lo O T 1T OWO
(@R TN R I ~ 1 + 1t ro ~+ n £ Dha 17 90~ ITa ~ht1 —~ o~ A + Naiaxza ]
[P P @ g =y L.J_J.L\_j T CIT [ S N G WP PR SRS ) WP W G 1T - LLLJ.J.J.J.r/u J.J.J.vLLVVLA_Y oS uawy CIT > awy L& g =y
Carinmt+ 12~ ~ 4 + o + N~ A n P =~ e Dha 17 4+~ IT9 ~htr +
OTT L._Y L TT T I (=) HL_/J.J., L./J. \— \w 8 P N LNV N W A & g =y J.L\_j LLLJ_J.J.J.L./L_J J.J.J.\jJ.J.VVL/L_Y T
+h 1t v o ot o n 4 1+ D) [OW.N D o A n r+h 1 neor Q4+ + D) A
C1IT LTI T CCT 1O o CITUTIT A [ & i 1IN T X [ S N N ) A\ Aw 5 ITO1TCTIT (A.J_Ull\:j o C T CT 1INOTXKD
[OW.N + + 1 1t r o ot o n £ T M1+ 1r DR+ 1 1r B Xz 1r D o A N o+
Py O CIT [ E N A 1 o CIUIT A\ O [ S U R N N R N OO C 1T D AN W (@ Enw [ S N N ) AW 5 (&% w




o
Sl &
o 0 . i
c — ] Q —
Tl O ] B o ~
ol 8 T & T 0 ]
(0] < O g
(o} o} @ ool & Py
a < ) — 0
B S i I~ e =] I a 0 o o
H D 7o I o B N o o 4 1 Y <l og
" ] b on o o Q) — ~ > iB) © — i) -
o O] o & A + @) >0 - 4 © 0 —
4 i P N ol — o = ) e S o o ie] c o
oo ” 0] —H o N oy o) c Q -
4P b5 ¢ 9 i o K b= -3 m ol S oy Rl o m
) S D ORI Sl o [0} 0 Sl o} g i
Lar sl a epheemJenm 2| g 2 .
T b e i i £ 4 ol @l & Slg 1 o] & y B o al 2
wor 9 oo A S T g . . S 3 al g b9
e R f: & 1 £ @ ] I TE] = “lol B o o) — =
j D . - K : © < o)
o4 CR H G b ol 5 Sl s A, A N 1 8 - 0 w2
R R S T © U R °l 2l % - c o . ol ¢ Q
R i R 0 A ©l a4 =] I at B A !
q & 4 -H - A 5 £ i h o o g S - t >
5 roo o & & - @ 8 5| o 5 o v
e P ® ) P i) ol [0 & (0] g el O W ol <l A < 13) %) ¢
pis} @ & [ah} d D n -H 4y W) 1b Y o) 1] c o O < c e} — D o c <
S Foo S TN Sl S e - v s, o SlH ° +
Pk T T " + ) | & o M ol O 9l £ I 1.
i S A £ 05 D@l@dﬂnfgn o 3 5 i
o) i H KT} o) ¢ -H 0 I q e} ko] = io] &)
T n i D o D (o] o) © o 0] O +
¢ 4 b 10) o 5 9 P
H L ORI H D + [0) @) - o () 0
® T E D -~ - el S © 0]
o £ 0 P h (O s ) o g 5| o 0wl oo 0]
4 O m = 0]
+ « N g ¢ v 4 g o - S 5 ol "l 9 — o ko 52
9 b i Uy & h ) ) Sl g
Ry & D 7, SN I ; O m H S 3 & ~ ._u ) > @ LOV o)
4b b —H P . d o) 4] H 0| S 1)) O ) > N - 4y [0) )
T ww - ] o (@) D [()) m.u_ g ﬁw 0 R (e} O ()] i) % 4 ) ()] o) c m )
- D D g & " o D H ] © o c 0]
b 4 T ¢ b ) ) < S o + 9,
g & @ S RO T & b 0 & m o | = = g = W ol &
: b T ) + 0
I Y A i by ol 5 9 w g B o S | s g o e
P N O Ed - -
® R} o) +# P i) uly [( by M._ ab ﬁw o H m 0n n_lu_ (o] — —l + m + H -
4 iy H uly D i D 09 o 5 5] B o - 5 + ! =
T T T B & D d b4 0 9 <l ol 5l S o w| B &
A T PP d, nw A I o) 0 ol M m S & % o >0
$od o) ot m Boow oo 5 I - 4 B ol o ey 0 3
P P £ ¢ R LR S ge) 29 & o 4 <l g o IS o
) ¢ 1 6 b S N S ¥ S o % g g 3 ol S Pl D o © o
N ] al b 4 “H = o . .
P P 0 ® & f h ) &b 509 + G © o 2| o 5 o
5.1 b A a o =4 o) g S 3
3 v | i ) A AR S I S 9 Bt IS 5 @l o S O o 5 ©l 5
m 0 5 A F o0 5 ¢ i J mw. ol = 0 m S| o i I 0 L=z < ©
poe o8 I & . mammnhmgg 8 o © i o
& h b N D jon g . -
D [N By N b ._.”_. @ - M“ “H H 4 £M__ O} @ © c .mw ) ._m_l.w Y Uw m m s
T b T & q S S ¢ kS — 20— gol
Py T 5 + g ._ o ko) o o 9] le) & < © 0] =
s @ D D O o 7 © P — &) a -~ n i) -~ 0 -
" D f cw R ¢ D] 1 1“ ww_ [ nl  © - Y 1m L& 0 4 ol o Y 5
b ﬁw YK h N o 5 uly 0] nl o = o m g 5 N M I, _1|__ % =
s & S (R T | > b3 m ol A g 5 o S “ql g e I ol 3l 8
H O & o £ 59 v oa o o] =1 Il e o Pl sl ¥ A RS
T T VA S X T 9 o of o o D g £ L2088 —
- s D B i d iR & o S - &lo sl 0 S-S,
B0 | T 4 o307 P b i B T NS
T 7 e ® R . w9 5 ol o SO09 8 8
Eoonoon &  h & Lo ‘&5 b @ g ol m N N
S | 5 (A O O ~ o~
) j(m b H H H 40 B s I B — N
-0 5 4 b oo PR & o O N N
onl D i ¥ ) P h A © -~ — N
o T P @ @ ooa o —
oo 5 B b Y 0 o < —
D S T S 383 9
_|M m m A o o S B
q & [e0] —
O ~
LO
N ™ N
—




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

125 miles per hour and east of the demarcation line 130 miles per

hour.

For Risk Category III and Risk Category IV structures as set forth

in the Florida Building Code, the wind speed west of the

demarcation line shall be 135 miles per hour and east of the

demarcation line 140 miles per hour.

An applicant for a building permit may choose to interpolate from

the actual wind speed maps instead of using those parameters noted

above. In such instance a location map with the wind speed

interpolation calculations shall be provided by a licensed engineer

or architect.

* * *
Section 2. Section 321.101 (Adoption of Appendices)
amended. Section 321.101 (Adoption of Appendices), Chapter 321

(Adoption of Building Code), Ordinance Code, are hereby amended in
part as follows:
CHAPTER 321. ADOPTION OF BUILDING CODE.
Sec. 321.101. Adoption of Appendices
The following appendices are hereby adopted as part of this
building code:
* * *

Florida Building Code--Residential Appendices A, B, C, E, F+—%6+
and O

Florida Building Code——Existing Building Appendices B+—E+ and D

* % *

Florida Building Code-Fuel Gas Appendices A, ane—B and C

* % *




Section 3. Effective Date. This ordinance shall become
effective upon signature by the Mayor or upon becoming effective
without the Mayor's signature.

Form Approved:

/s/ Dylan T. Reingold

Office of General Counsel
Legislation Prepared By: Dylan T. Reingold

G:\SHARED\LEGIS.CC\2012\Ord\LAND USE GENERAL\Building Code and Wind loads.doc




